Saginaw County Road Commission Tailgate Spreading Aggregate Bids

2010 Spring Gravel

Specification Stone Wirt Saginaw
Products Fisher Transportation Stone Dock Jarmco Corporation
PROJECT PROJECT PROJECT
PRICE PER PRICE PER | PROJECT PRICE | PRICE PER PRICE PER
mﬁe‘;\tj?g); Township E;;de From To F;\IFEJ?AJBEERT 'E:\EA'I\‘LGETS'; TON | TON FOR 23A PR'ggAFOR TON FOR 23A FOR 23A TON FOR 23A PR'?EAFOR TON FOR 23A PREEAFOR
LIMESTONE | |\ N | LIMESTONE LIMESTONE LIMESTONE | ||\ * T NE | UMESTONE | |\ NE
2801 04 - Brady Baldwin Raucholz Fordney 496G0402 - 111} 0.50 500 [$ 1270 | $ 6,350.00 | $ 1366 | $ 6,830.00 | $ 1476 | $ 7,380.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 7,640.00
04 - Brady / 09 -
2799 Chapin 50/50 Steel Gary Baldwin 496G0406 - 171 0.96 960 |$ 12.90 | $ 12,384.00 | $ 1403 |$ 13,468.80 | $ 14.99 | $ 14,390.40 | $ 15.28 | $ 14,668.80
19 - Richland / 14 -
2820 Jonesfield 50/50 Steel Frost Dice 496G1907 - 301 1.00 1000 | $ 11.80 | $ 11,800.00 | $ 1275|$  12,750.00 | $ 1254 | $ 12,540.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 15,280.00
2821 19 - Richland Dice Raucholz Fordney 496G1911 - 251f 1.00 1000 | $ 11.40 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 1228 |$  12,280.00 | $ 12.54 | $ 12,540.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 15,280.00
2827 09 - Chapin Steel Ridge County Line 496G0431 - 131f 0.33 330 [$ 1140 $ 3,762.00| $ 1533 $ 5,058.90 | $ 1499 | $ 4,946.70 | $ 15.28 | $ 5,042.40
Swan
2839 13 - James Creek & |Gravel End 493G1304 - 041f 0.20 200 |$ 10.80 [ $ 2,160.00 | $ 1293 | $ 2,586.00 | $ 1225 | $ 2,450.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 3,056.00
2876 05 - Brant Burt Paved area E.|Rauchols 496G0535 - 031 1.50 1500 | $ 12.70 | $ 19,050.00 | $ 1357|$ 20,355.00 | $ 1438 | $ 21,570.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 22,920.00
2877 05 - Brant Schroeder |Brennan Stevens 496G0517 - 131f 1.50 1500 | $ 12.70 | $ 19,050.00 | $ 13.66 [ $  20,490.00 | $ 14.38 | $ 21,570.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 22,920.00
09 - Chapin/ 18 -
2834 Marion Gary Fenmore Merrill 496G1834 - 012 0.99 990 |[$ 12.90 | $ 12,771.00 | $ 1440 |$  14,256.00 | $ 1476 | $ 14,612.40 | $ 15.28 | $ 15,127.20
09 - Chapin/ 18 -
2835 Marion Gary Meridian Fenmore 496G1833-011f 1.12 1120 | $ 13.00 | $ 14,560.00 | $ 1440 |$  16,128.00 | $ 1476 | $ 16,531.20 | $ 15.28 | $ 17,113.60
09 - Chapin/ 18 -
2836 Marion Gary Chapin Steel 496G1836 - 021f 1.02 1020 | $ 12.90 | $ 13,158.00 | $ 1403|$ 1431060 $ 14.76 | $ 15,055.20 | $ 15.28 | $ 15,585.60
2884 18 - Marion Fenmore [Brant N. to Pavement  |496G1815 - 131] 1.50 1500 | $ 12.90 | $ 19,350.00 | $ 1403 |$ 21,045.00 | $ 14.76 | $ 22,140.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 22,920.00
2885 18 - Marion Meridian  [Washington [N. 3/4 mile to Twp 1J496G1804 - 161f 0.70 700 | $ 1290 | $ 9,030.00 | $ 1403 $ 9,821.00 | $ 1476 | $ 10,332.00 | $ 15.28 | $ 10,696.00
13 - James /25 -
2851 Thomas Ederer Miller River 496G2536 - 021f 0.50 500 |$ 10.80 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 1200 $ 6,000.00 No Bid $ - $ 15.28 | $ 7,640.00
12 - Fremont / 23 -
2818 Swan Creek Orr Baumgartner |Lakefield 496G2319-221f 1.98 1980 | $ 11.80 | $ 23,364.00 | $ 1275[$  25,245.00 No Bid $ - $ 15.28 | $ 30,254.40
12 - Fremont /19 -
2822 Richland Ederer Fordney Pretzer 496G1935-031 0.52 520 |$ 1140 $ 5928.00]| $ 1275 $ 6,630.00 No Bid $ - $ 15.28 | $ 7,945.60
2811 16 - Lakefield Chapin Townline S. to Twp. Line 496G1636 - 131 0.25 250 [ $ 1220 | $ 3,050.00 | $ 1431 | $ 3,577.50 No Bid $ - $ 15.28 | $ 3,820.00
2812 16 - Lakefield Steel Lakefield Swan Creek 496G1218 - 231 1.99 1990 | $ 12.10 | $ 24,079.00 | $ 1348[$  26,825.20 No Bid $ - $ 15.28 | $ 30,407.20
Total Miles 17.56 17560 [ $  219.30 | $216,646.00 | $ 244.39[$ 237,657.00| $  184.63 | $176,057.90 [ $  275.04 | $268,316.80




