Saginaw County Road Commission Bid Tabulations 2010

PROPOSAL NO. 1 — Unleaded Gas — Saginaw

Name of Bidder [

Shipping Point

Brand Name

Price per Gallon

Gibson Oil Co. |

Saginaw

Marathon

$1.7725

PROPOSAL NO. 2 — Unleaded Gas — Chesaning

Name of Bidder [

Shipping Point

Brand Name

Price per Gallon

Gibson Oil Co. |

Saginaw

Marathon

$1.7725

PROPOSAL NO. 3 — Unleaded Gas — Hemlock

Name of Bidder [

Shipping Point

Brand Name

Price per Gallon

Gibson Oil Co. |

Saginaw

Marathon

$1.7725

PROPOSAL NO. 4 — Diesel Fuel — Saginaw

Name of Bidder

Brand Name

Price per Gallon — 1D

Price per Gallon — 2D

Gibson Oil Co.

BP/Amaco & Marathon

$1.825

$1.795

Petroleum TradersCorp.

Marathon

$2.2965

$1.9375

PROPOSAL NO. 5 — Diesel Fuel — Chesaning

Name of Bidder

Brand Name

Price per Gallon — 1D

Price per Gallon — 2D

Gibson Oil Co.

BP/Amaco & Marathon

$1.825

$1.795

Petroleum TradersCorp.

Marathon

$2.2965

$1.9375

PROPOSAL NO. 6 — Diesel Fuel — Hemlock

Name of Bidder

Brand Name

Price per Gallon — 1D

Price per Gallon — 2D

Gibson Qil Co.

BP/Amaco & Marathon

$1.825

$1.795

Petroleum TradersCorp.

Marathon

$2.2965

$1.9375
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Proposal No. 9 — Highway Traffic Signs

Series 3930 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
12" x 36" $10.50 $5.01 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 42" $24.50 $11.69 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 30" $21.87 $10.44 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 18" $5.25 $2.51 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 36" $26.25 $12.53 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 18" $13.12 $6.26 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
48" x 24" $28.00 $13.36 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 30" $17.50 $8.35 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 24" $14.00 $6.68 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 18" $10.00 $5.01 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 12" $3.50 $1.67 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 6" $2.00 $0.84 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
48" x 30" $35.00 $16.70 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" x 36" $31.50 $15.03 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
Series 3930 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" x 30" $21.87 $10.44 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" x 36" $31.50 $15.03 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 24" $14.00 $6.68 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 30" $17.50 $8.35 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 18" $5.25 $2.51 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 36" $26.25 $12.53 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 18" $13.12 $6.26 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" STOP AHEAD $31.50 $18.28 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" SIGNAL AHEAD $31.50 $18.28 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" x 48" x 48" NO PASSING ZONE $42.00 $9.84 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
48" x 24" $28.00 $13.36 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 36" $10.50 $5.01 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 18" $10.50 $5.01 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 42" $24.50 $11.69 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 12" $3.50 $1.67 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 6" $3.50 $0.84 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
48" x 30" $35.00 $16.70 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" YIELD AHEAD $31.50 $18.28 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" ROUND $31.50 $15.03 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 12" $8.75 $4.18 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
Series 4084 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" DIAMOND $35.37 $21.69 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
48" DIAMOND $90.56 $55.52 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
48" x 18" $33.96 $20.82 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" DIAMOND $50.94 $31.23 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 24" $28.30 $17.35 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
Series 4083 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" DIAMOND $50.94 $37.08 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 12" $14.15 $10.30 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 18" $21.22 $15.45 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 8" $11.32 $5.48 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 12" $11.32 $8.24 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
Series 4000 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" STOP $61.93 $48.68 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" STOP $89.19 $60.61 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
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Series 4000 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" STOP $71.19 $53.37 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" STOP $49.43 $37.06 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" YIELD $71.19 $23.52 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 6" 3-WAY $3.95 $2.97 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
12" x 6" 4-WAY $3.95 $2.97 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
Series 3930 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 48" x 48" NO PASSING ZONE $57.50 $23.91 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" ROUND ADVANCE RAILROAD $51.75 $35.46 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
Series 4083 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" SCHOOL $71.90 $57.87 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" DIAMOND $71.90 $57.87 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
Series 3930 Michigan Highway Signs Rocal, Inc. Custom Products Co. IBIS Tek
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
24" x 6" $5.75 $13.90 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 6" $7.18 $17.38 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" x 6" $8.62 $20.85 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
24" x 9" $8.62 $20.85 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
30" x 9" $10.75 $26.13 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
36" x 9" $12.93 $31.28 Disqualified - Arrived Late Disqualified - Arrived Late
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Proposal No. 11 — Metal Culvert Pipe and Bands

ITEM #1
Pipe size 12" 15" 18" 21" 24" 30" 36" 42" 48" 54"
Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. 5.41 6.7 8.35 9.86 10.83 13.74 17.64 20.72 23.91 35.08
Does Not
Does Not Meet
ADS Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs.  |Meet Specs.| Specs.
Contech $5.48 $6.58 $8.22 No Bid $10.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
St. Regis $4.98 $6.06 $7.92 $8.98 $10.36 $13.63 $17.40 $20.40 $22.80 $43.20
Premarc $5.25 $6.58 $8.18 $9.20 $10.41 $15.90 $19.25 $22.50 $39.50 $54.97
Bands
Same as
Sameas 2| 2ft of
Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. Same as 1 % ft. of Pipe Same as 1 ¥ ft. of Pipe Same as 1 % ft. of Pipe Same as 1 ¥ ft. of Pipe Same as 2 ft. of Pipe Same as 2 ft. of Pipe Same as 2 ft. of Pipe Same as 2 ft. of Pipe ft. of Pipe Pipe
Does Not
Does Not Meet
ADS Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs.  |Meet Specs.| Specs.
Same as 1| Same as
¥ ft. of 1% ft. of
Contech Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe| Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Pipe Pipe
Same as 1| Same as
Y ft. of 1% ft. of
St. Regis Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Same as 1% ft. of Pipe| Same as 1% ft. of Pipe Pipe Pipe
Premarc 7.88 9.87 12.27 13.80 15.62 31.80 38.50 45.00 79.00 109.94
ITEM #2
[ Multi-Plate Pipe Arch - See File [
| |
ITEM #3
Metal Pipe Arch
Jensen Bridge & Supply Co. No Bid 7.03 8.76 10.35 14.41 18.37 22.55 26.49 40.35 68.85
Does Not
Does Not Meet
ADS Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs. Does Not Meet Specs.  |Meet Specs.| Specs.
Add 6% to
Add 6% to | Cost of
Contech Add 6% to Cost of Pipe Add 6% to Cost of Pipe Add 6% to Cost of Pipe Add 6% to Cost of Pipe Add 6% to Cost of Pipe Add 6% to Cost of Pipe Add 6% to Cost of Pipe Add 6% to Cost of Pipe | Cost of Pipe Pipe
St. Regis No Bid $7.31 $9.14 $10.35 $11.57 $14.62 $18.10 $29.15 No Bid No Bid
Premarc No Bid $6.91 $8.59 $9.66 $10.93 $16.70 $20.21 $23.63 $41.48 $57.72

Proposal #14 Ready Mix Concrete - Wet or Dry

F.O.B. County Trucks at Plant — 4% Sack

Bidder's Name

Price/Cu. Yard

Rock Redi-Mix

$59.00

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites — Saginaw County 5 Yards and Over

Bidder's Name

5 Sack per cu. Yard

9 Sack per cu. yard

Price Per Cubic Yard

Rock Redi-Mix

$77.00

$101.00

No Charge

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites — Saginaw County 4 to 5 Yards

Bidder's Name

5 Sack

9 Sack

Price Per Cubic Yard

Rock Redi-Mix

Add $20 Per Load

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites — Saginaw County 3 to 4 Yards

Bidder's Name

5 Sack

9 Sack

Price Per Cubic Yard

Rock Redi-Mix

Add $40 Per Load

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites — Saginaw County 2 to 3 Yards

Bidder's Name

5 Sack

9 Sack

Price Per Cubic Yard

Rock Redi-Mix

Add $60 Per Load

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites — Saginaw County Under 2 Yards

Bidder's Name

5 Sack

9 Sack

Price Per Cubic Yard
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Rock Redi-Mix |

Add $80 Per Load

Proposal No. 18 — Topsoil & Seeding

Bidder's Name Topsoil 3" Depth Hydro-Seed
Michigan Landscape Contractors $2.80 $0.75
Allen Contracting Services $3.00 $0.85
Weyand Bros. $2.21 $0.69
Murin Company $2.75 $0.45

LaVant Landscape

Disqualified - Bid Rec'd at 11:41 A.M. on 12-14-09 - After Bid Opening

Proposal No. 20 Roadside Vegitation Contr

ol Spraying - 2007 Bid Extended for 2008

Bidder's Name

Item A: Brush Control

Item B: Brush Control

Item C: Cattail Vegetation

Item D: Guard Rail

(Sensitive Areas) Control Vegetation Control
Village Green $0.86 $1.33 $0.74 $0.075
The Dalton's $0.849 $1.38 $0.895 $0.065

Proposal No. 21 — Curb & Gutter Removal &

Replacement

Bidder's Name

Removal & Replace (including
excavation)

New (not including
excavation)

New (including excavation)

Streeter Bros. $32.50 15.50 $17.50
Allen Contracting Services $21.80 16.80 $20.90
Wobig Construction Co. $24.50 19.50 $23.50

Proposal No. 22 — Stump Removal

Bidder's Name

Price per Inch

Price per Hour

Tri-City Contracting $1.00 $95.00
Allen Benjamin Tree Care $0.95 $90.00
Heinz Tree Service $1.75 $125.00
Allen Contracting Services $2.00 $200.00

Proposal No. 23 — Limestone 29A
Description 1 29A Limestone

Bidder’'s Name

Geddes Road Borrow Pit

Curtis Road Borrow Pit

Chesaning Garage

Hemlock Garage

S.C.R.C. Garage

Pick-up By Rd. Comm.

Trucks

Wirt Stone Dock $16.84 $16.84 $19.01 $17.94 $15.69 $13.29
Fisher Transportation Co. $18.04 $17.84 $19.84 $18.44 $17.34 No Bid
Bay Aggregate $18.23 $17.92 $20.03 $18.52 $17.53 $14.75
Burroughs Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sargent Dock/Saginaw Rock $15.74 $15.41 $17.51 $15.96 $14.93 $13.25
Specification Stone $15.89 $15.20 $17.24 $16.95 $15.28 $12.75
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Description 2 29A Slag

Bidder's Name Geddes Road Borrow Pit Curtis Road Borrow Pit Chesaning Garage Hemlock Garage S.C.R.C. Garage PICk‘Up_ﬁi(ﬁ:’S’ Comm.
Wirt Stone Dock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Transportation Co. $26.43 $26.23 $28.23 $26.83 $25.73 No Bid
Bay Aggregate $26.45 $26.36 $28.47 $26.96 $25.97 $23.75
Burroughs Materials $21.50 $21.75 $22.50 $22.75 $21.00 $19.00
Sargent Dock/Saginaw Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Specification Stone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Description 3, CS @ Trap Rock

Bidder's Name Geddes Road Borrow Pit Curtis Road Borrow Pit Chesaning Garage Hemlock Garage S.C.R.C. Garage PICk‘Up_ﬁi(ﬁ:’S’ Comm.
Wirt Stone Dock $22.85 $22.33 $24.93 $24.15 $21.55 $18.95
Fisher Transportation Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bay Aggregate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Burroughs Materials No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sargent Dock/Saginaw Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Specification Stone No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Proposal No. 26 — Crushed Limestonetone — 23A

Bidder's Name

Loading Point Location

Loading Point

Saginaw Garage

Chesaning Garage

Hemlock Garage

Fisher Transportation Co. (Left Blank) No Bid $13.64 $16.14 $14.74
Bay Aggregate Bay City Dock $10.85 $13.86 $16.33 $15.03

Wirt Stone Dock Saginaw Dock $9.10 $11.50 $14.82 $13.75
Sargent Dock/Saginaw Rock Saginaw Rock Products $10.25 $11.93 $14.51 $12.96
Specification Stone Kawkawlin $9.75 $12.61 $14.60 $13.90

Alt. Bid - See Form
Alt. Bid - See Form



