Saginaw County Road Commission Tailgate Spreading Aggregate Bids
2009 Spring Gravel

Sargent Docks & Wirt Saginaw
L & D Carey & Sons Terminal Fisher Transportation Stone Dock Burroughs Materials
PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR| PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR| PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR [ PRICE FOR . .
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GRAVEL LIMESTON GRAVEL |LIMESTONE| GRAVEL [LIMESTONE| GRAVEL |LIMESTONE| GRAVEL LIMESTON
2446 Blumfield N. Gera Hack Wilshire 496G0302-441| 0.94 940 $ 11.60 | $ 11.95 No Bid $ 1273 | $ 843 ([ $ 11.47 No Bid $ 11.33 No Bid $ 13.20 | $7,924.20 | $10,650.20
2454 Taymouth Elms Busch Lange 496G2401-471| 0.67 670 $ 13.00 | $ 12.95 No Bid $ 13.09 | $ 843 ([ $ 12.73 No Bid $ 11.83 No Bid $ 13.20 | $5,648.10 $7,926.10
2455 Taymouth Marshall Courtney Willard 496G2435-371| 0.51 510 $ 12.75 | $ 13.00 No Bid $ 1360 | $ 864 % 13.74 No Bid $ 12.33 No Bid $ 14.20 | $4,406.40 $6,288.30
2456 Taymouth Judd Moorish Elms 496G2412-171| 0.83 830 $ 1290 | $ 12.90 No Bid $ 12731 $ 843 ([ $ 12.81 No Bid $ 11.83 No Bid $ 13.20 | $6,996.90 $9,818.90
2474 Lakefield Chapin Swan Creek Ederer 496G1601-151( 1.01 1010 [ $ 1040 | $ 13.25 No Bid $ 1345| $ 8491 % 13.74 No Bid $ 12.94 No Bid $ 14.85| $8,574.90 [ $13,069.40
2475 Lakefield Fenmore Twp Line Grabowski 496G1634-101| 1.03 1030 $ 1040 | $ 14.75 No Bid $ 1387 | $ 776 $ 14.38 No Bid $ 13.95 No Bid $ 14.85 | $7,992.80 | $14,286.10
2476 Lakefield Grabowski [Meridian Fenmore 496G1628-11 | 1.00 1000 | $ 10.40 | $ 14.75 No Bid $ 13.87 | $ 776 [ $ 14.38 No Bid $ 13.95 No Bid $ 14.85 | $7,760.00 [ $13,870.00
2477 Lakefield Chapin Nelson Lakefield 496G1624-141| 1.00 1000 $ 1040 | $ 14.75 No Bid $ 1345| $ 818 [ $ 14.38 No Bid $ 13.44 No Bid $ 14.85 | $8,180.00 | $13,440.00
2557 Fremont Iva Grabowski Nelson 496G1230-241| 0.96 960 $ 10.50 | $ 13.75 No Bid $ 1345 | $ 839 $ 13.93 No Bid $ 13.44 No Bid $ 14.20 | $8,054.40 [ $12,902.40
2558 Fremont Beaver Fordney Orr 496G1236-031( 1.02 1020 $ 1050 [ $ 13.40 No Bid $ 1345| $ 891 $ 13.93 No Bid $ 12.94 No Bid $ 13.20 | $9,088.20 | $13,198.80
2561 Marion Fenmore |[Gary Burt 496G1833-011( 1.00 2000 | $ 1025 | $ 15.00 No Bid $ 1387 $ 7971 $ 15.22 No Bid $ 14.45 No Bid $ 15.30 | $15,940.00 [ $27,740.00
2562 Marion Fenmore Burt Marion 496G1828-121( 0.51 1020 $ 1025 | $ 15.00 No Bid $ 1387 | $ 797 [ $ 15.22 No Bid $ 14.45 No Bid $ 15.30 | $8,129.40 | $14,147.40
2563 Marion Fenmore [Marion Brant 496G1821-121( 1.00 2000 | $ 10.25 | $ 15.00 No Bid $ 1345 | $ 797 [ $ 15.22 No Bid $ 13.95 No Bid $ 14.85 | $15,940.00 [ $26,900.00
2568 St. Charles Mahoney  [Burt 1/2 mi. S. of Fergus| 496G2127-401| 1.07 1070 $ 12.00 [ $ 14.25 No Bid $ 1325| $ 864 $ 13.93 No Bid $ 12.94 No Bid $ 1440 | $9,244.80 | $13,845.80
2577 Richland Brennan Dice Tittabawassee 496G1904-401| 1.20 1200 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1345 | $ 9.86 | $ 12.81 No Bid $ 11.83 No Bid $ 13.70 | $11,832.00 [ $14,196.00
2578 Richland O'Hara Fordney Orr 496G1914-161 0.75 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 13.09 | $ 9.86 | $ 12.73 No Bid $ 11.83 No Bid $ 13.25 | $7,395.00 $8,872.50
2579 Richland Doyle Hemlock Watson 496G1934-61 0.50 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1273 | $ 9.86 [ $ 12.73 No Bid $ 12.33 No Bid $ 13.70 | $4,930.00 $6,165.00
2585 James McDonagh |End of Asphalt [Beyond Last Home | 496G1301-000| 0.09 90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 12731 $ 1075 | $ 14.30 No Bid $ 11.83 No Bid $ 13.20 $967.50 $1,064.70

Total Miles 15.09 17600
ADD - Sargent Docks & Wirt Saginaw
ONS L & D Carey & Sons Terminal Fisher Transportation Stone Dock Burroughs Materials
PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR| PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR| PRICE FOR | PRICE FOR [ PRICE FOR . .
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2605 Brady Raucholz  [Baldwin Gary 496G0402-271 0.96 960 $ 13.79 $ 13.87 $ 14.28 $ 13.80 $ 13.00 $ 12,480.00
2607 Albee Bueche Fry End of Pavement |[496G0108-261| 1.56 1560 $ 12.15 $ 12.73 $ 12.61 $ 12.33 $ 12.25 $ 18,954.00
2608 Albee Horning Cut|Alicia to north 496G0108-201| 1.00 1000 $ 12.35 $ 12.73 $ 12.61 $ 12.33 $ 12.35 $ 12,330.00
2609 Albee Rathbun End of Pavemen|Bueche 496G0114-81 | 0.40 400 $ 12.28 $ 12.73 $ 12.61 $ 12.33 $ 12.35 $ 4,912.00

Total Miles 3.92 3920




