

Saginaw County Road Commission
2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

Proposal No. 11 – Metal Culvert Pipe and Bands

ITEM 1 - CMP

Jensen Bridge & Supply Company, 400 Stoney Creek Drive, P.O. Box 151, Sandusky, MI 48471 810-648-3000						
Pipe Diameter	16 Gauge	14 Gauge	12 Gauge	10 Gauge	8 Gauge	Bands
12"	\$5.40	\$7.19	\$9.52	N/A	N/A	\$8.10
15"	\$6.40	\$8.96	\$10.70	N/A	N/A	\$9.60
18"	\$8.14	\$11.13	\$15.06	N/A	N/A	\$12.21
21"	\$9.14	\$13.03	\$17.06	N/A	N/A	\$13.71
24"	\$10.60	\$13.43	\$20.71	N/A	N/A	\$15.90
30"	\$17.90	\$16.90	\$23.97	\$33.74	N/A	\$31.32
36"	\$18.84	\$21.30	\$29.47	\$41.32	N/A	\$37.27
42"	\$22.11	\$26.94	\$34.91	\$48.24	N/A	\$61.09
48"	\$26.90	\$32.72	\$38.20	\$55.13	\$68.58	\$76.40
54"	\$32.86	\$39.20	\$49.88	\$64.37	\$79.42	\$99.96

Cadillac Culvert, Inc, 5305 Higway M-115, Cadillac, MI 49601 231-775-3761						
Pipe Diameter	16 Gauge	14 Gauge	12 Gauge	10 Gauge	8 Gauge	Bands
12"	\$5.34	\$6.85	\$9.08	N/A	N/A	
15"	\$6.38	\$8.10	\$10.62	N/A	N/A	
18"	\$8.10	\$10.19	\$14.28	N/A	N/A	
21"	\$9.49	\$11.93	\$16.20	N/A	N/A	
24"	\$10.58	\$13.70	\$19.60	N/A	N/A	
30"	\$14.13	\$16.90	\$22.60	N/A	N/A	
36"	\$17.70	\$21.20	\$27.99	\$35.25	N/A	
42"	\$20.82	\$24.95	\$32.94	\$41.49	N/A	
48"	\$23.25	\$28.30	\$38.15	\$48.05	N/A	
54"	\$26.15	\$31.85	\$42.90	\$54.03	N/A	

12" Wide = 1.75' of pipe
24" Wide = 2.25' of pipe

St. Regis Culvert Inc., 202 Morrell Street, Charlotte, MI 48813 800-527-4604						
Pipe Diameter	16 Gauge	14 Gauge	12 Gauge	10 Gauge	8 Gauge	Bands
12"	\$5.48	\$7.80	\$13.60	N/A	N/A	
15"	\$6.60	\$9.75	\$17.00	N/A	N/A	
18"	\$8.30	\$11.70	\$20.40	N/A	N/A	
21"	\$9.50	\$13.65	\$24.65	N/A	N/A	
24"	\$10.95	\$15.60	\$28.05	N/A	N/A	
30"	\$14.85	\$19.50	\$33.85	N/A	N/A	
36"	\$17.90	\$23.40	\$34.75	N/A	N/A	
42"	\$21.20	\$27.30	\$40.40	N/A	N/A	
48"	\$23.60	\$31.20	\$42.00	N/A	N/A	
54"	N/A	\$35.10	\$51.85	\$65.80	N/A	

1 ft wide bands = 1.65 x's per foot price
2 ft. Wide bands = 2 x's per foot price

Saginaw County Road Commission
 2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

ITEM 2 - Poly-Coated CMP

Jensen Bridge & Supply Company, 400 Stoney Creek Drive, P.O. Box 151, Sandusky, MI 48471 810-648-3000								
Pipe Diameter	16 Gauge	14 Gauge	12 Gauge	10 Gauge	8 Gauge		Bands	Lifting Lugs
12"	\$8.02	\$9.67	N/A	N/A	N/A		\$ 12.03	50.25/Ea.
15"	\$9.81	\$12.00	N/A	N/A	N/A		\$ 14.71	
18"	\$11.74	\$14.33	N/A	N/A	N/A		\$ 17.61	
21"	\$13.58	\$16.63	N/A	N/A	N/A		\$ 20.37	
24"	\$15.50	\$18.95	\$28.42	N/A	N/A		\$ 23.25	
30"	\$19.29	\$23.60	\$33.28	N/A	N/A		\$ 41.30	
36"	\$23.06	\$30.03	\$40.54	N/A	N/A		\$ 52.55	
42"	\$26.85	\$33.23	\$47.04	\$65.45	N/A		\$ 58.15	
48"	\$32.98	\$39.90	\$52.10	\$75.60	N/A		\$ 79.80	
54"	\$39.82	\$47.37	\$61.02	\$85.90	N/A		\$ 94.74	

St. Regis Culvert Inc., 202 Morrell Street, Charlotte, MI 48813 800-527-4604								
Pipe Diameter	16 Gauge	14 Gauge	12 Gauge	10 Gauge	8 Gauge		Bands	Lifting Lugs
12"	\$8.80	\$10.61	N/A	N/A	N/A			
15"	\$10.60	\$13.30	N/A	N/A	N/A			
18"	\$13.30	\$15.92	N/A	N/A	N/A			
21"	\$15.10	\$18.60	N/A	N/A	N/A			
24"	\$16.80	\$21.25	N/A	N/A	N/A			
30"	\$21.25	\$26.55	N/A	N/A	N/A			
36"	\$25.64	\$31.83	\$44.84	N/A	N/A			
42"	\$30.16	\$37.15	\$52.16	N/A	N/A			
48"	\$33.60	\$42.45	\$59.48	N/A	N/A			
54"	N/A	\$47.75	\$66.80	\$84.20	N/A			

Saginaw County Road Commission
2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

Proposal #14 Ready Mix Concrete - Wet or Dry

F.O.B. County Trucks at Plant – 4½ Sack

Bidder's Name	Price/Cu. Yard	Free Delivery Zone	Add Price per Cubic Yard per mile past free delivery Zone	Add Price per Cubic Yard at or after 3:00 pm	Add Price per Cubic Yard Saturday	Free Unloading Time	Dummerage	Add Price per Cubic Yard Chloride Concrete
	\$100.00	Within 25 Mile radius of plant	\$3.00	No Bid	\$3.00	One Hour	No Charge	\$1.50 per cyd @ 1%

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 5 Yards and Over

Bidder's Name	5 Sack per cu. Yard	9 Sack per cu. yard
Rock Products Co. 1701 N. First St Saginaw, MI 48605 989-754-6589	\$104.00	\$136.00

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 4 to 5 Yards

Bidder's Name	5 Sack	9 Sack
Rock Products Co. 1701 N. First St Saginaw, MI 48605 989-754-6589	\$124.00	\$156.00

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 3 to 4 Yards

Bidder's Name	5 Sack	9 Sack
Rock Products Co. 1701 N. First St Saginaw, MI 48605 989-754-6589	\$144.00	\$176.00

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 2 to 3 Yards

Bidder's Name	5 Sack	9 Sack
Rock Products Co. 1701 N. First St Saginaw, MI 48605 989-754-6589	\$164.00	\$196.00

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County Under 2 Yards

Bidder's Name	5 Sack	9 Sack
Rock Products Co. 1701 N. First St Saginaw, MI 48605 989-754-6589	\$184.00	\$216.00

Proposal No. 18- Topsoil & Seeding

Bidders Name	Topsoil 3" Depth (Per Sq. Yd)	"Hydro-Seed" or "Class A Seeding, Fertilizing and Mulching
Rodney Woods Builder 2300 S. Thomas Rd Saginaw, MI 48605 989-754-6589	\$6.50	\$6.85
Martha Brown Custom Builders LLC 10076 Sheridan Rd Burt, MI 48417 989-770-9915	\$6.00	\$6.55
Murin Company 2243 N. Graham Rd Freeland, MI 48623 989-781-1850	\$4.00	\$0.90 Plus Finish Grading

Saginaw County Road Commission
2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

Proposal No. 19- Asphalt Emulsions

Bidder's Name	Bit-Mat Products of Michigan 401 Tiernan Rd Bay City, MI 48706 989-684-0341	Michigan Paving & Materials Co. 1950 Williams St. Alma, MI 48801 989-402-5932	Asphalt Materials, Inc. 940 N. Wynn Rd Oregon, OH 43616 419-693-0626
HFRS-2M F.O.B. Shipping Point	\$1.50	\$1.40	\$2.00
HFRS-2M F.O.B. Job Site	\$1.538	\$1.45	\$2.09
HFRS-2 F.O.B. Shipping Point	\$1.45	\$1.35	\$1.70
HFRS-2 F.O.B. Job Site	\$1.488	\$1.40	\$1.79
Demurrage	\$92.00/Hour	\$90.00/Hr	\$90.00/Hr
Chiplock F.O.B. Shipping Point	\$1.24	\$1.09	No Bid
Chiplock F.O.B. Job Site	\$1.278	\$1.14	No Bid
Fogseal	No Bid	\$1.11	\$1.50
Fogseal F.O.B Job Site	No Bid	\$1.16	\$1.59
Pep-Dilute	\$1.20	No Bid	No Bid

Proposal No. 20 – Roadside Vegetation Spraying

Bidder's Name	Item A: Brush Control	Item B: Brush Control (Sensitive Areas)	Item C: Guard Rail Vegetation Control	Item D: Cattail & Phragmites Control	Dept. of Agriculture ROW License (Cat. 6)
The Daltons Inc. P.O. Box 724 North Webster, IN 46555 574-453-1229	\$0.795	\$1.71	0.065	0.89	
Village Green 1616 Tech Dr Bay City, MI 48706 989-737-6047	\$0.84	\$1.75	0.07	0.88	

Proposal No. 21 – Curb & Gutter Removal & Replacement

Bidder's Name	Removal & Replace (including excavation)	New (not including excavation)	New (including excavation)
Agnew Construction 4097 Pierce Rd Saginaw, MI 48604 989-751-3168	\$35.00	\$23.00	\$30.00
Mid Michigan Contracting 5563 Dixie Hwy Saginaw, MI 48601 989-799-1004	\$28.00	28.00	\$28.00
Martha Brown Custom Builders LLC 10076 Sheridan Rd Burt, MI 48417 989-770-9915	\$25.00	23.00	\$25.00

Saginaw County Road Commission
2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

Proposal No. 23-A – C S 2 Trap Rock & 29A Limestone 50/50 Blend

Bidder's Name	Burrough North 1701 N. 1st Street Saginaw, MI 48601 989-737-2861	WIRT Saginaw Stone Dock 4700 Crow Island Road Saginaw, MI 48601 989-753-6404
Geddes Road Borrow Pit	\$26.85	\$26.10
Curtis Road Borrow Pit	\$26.85	\$26.10
Chesaning Garage	\$28.20	\$27.45
Hemlock Garage	\$27.25	\$26.60
S.C.R.C. Garage	\$25.80	\$25.15
Pick-up by Road Comm. Trucks	\$23.25	\$22.60
Albee Twp.	\$27.10	\$26.45
Birch Run Twp.	\$27.20	\$26.55
Blumfield Twp.	\$26.15	\$25.50
Brady Twp.	\$28.65	\$28.00
Brant Twp.	\$28.45	\$27.80
Bridgeport Twp.	\$26.10	\$25.45
Buena Vista Twp.	\$25.75	\$25.10
Carrollton Twp.	\$25.75	\$25.10
Chapin Twp.	\$29.10	\$28.45
Chesaning Twp.	\$28.45	\$27.85
Frankenmuth Twp.	\$27.10	\$26.45
Fremont Twp.	\$27.50	\$26.85
James Twp.	\$26.25	\$25.60
Jonesfield Twp.	\$27.45	\$26.80
Kochville Twp.	\$26.15	\$25.50
Lakefield Twp.	\$28.35	\$27.70
Maple Grove Twp.	\$27.40	\$26.75
Marion Twp.	\$28.60	\$27.95
Richland Twp.	\$27.40	\$26.75
Saginaw Twp.	\$26.25	\$25.60
St. Charles Twp.	\$27.45	\$26.80
Spaulding Twp.	\$26.50	\$25.85
Swan Creek Twp.	\$27.15	\$26.50
Taymouth Twp.	\$27.15	\$26.50
Thomas Twp.	\$26.65	\$26.00
Tittabawassee Twp.	\$26.65	\$26.00
Zilwaukee Twp.	\$26.15	\$25.50

Proposal No. 24 – Bituminous Sand - 2NS

Bidder's Name	Geddes Road Borrow Pit	Curtis Road Borrow Pit	Chesaning Garage	Hemlock Garage	S.C.R.C. Garage	Pick-up By Rd. Comm. Trucks	
Rodney Woods Builder 2300 S. Thomas Rd Saginaw, MI 48609 989-280-3069	\$9.00	\$10.75	\$7.50	\$9.25	\$11.00	\$5.50	
D.H.T 2695 W. Vassar Rd Reese, MI 48757	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$10.00	No Bid	

Saginaw County Road Commission
2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

Proposal No. 26 – Crushed Limestone – 23A

Bidder's Name	WIRT Saginaw Stone Dock 4700 Crow Island Rd Saginaw, MI 48601 989-753-6404	Specification Stone Products 1009 Long Lake Ave Alpena, MI 49707 989-667-4336	Fisher Transportation Company Inc 900 S. Bradley Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858 989-773-1376	Burroughs North 1701 N. 1st Street Saginaw, MI 48601 989-737-2861
Loading Point (Location)	4700 Crow Island Rd, Saginaw, MI 48601	2594 Old Kawkawlin Road Kawkawlin, MI 48631		1701 N. 1st Street, Saginaw, MI 48601
F.O.B. Loading Point	\$11.85	\$11.80	No Bid	\$13.60
F.O.B. Saginaw Garage (4000 ton approx)	\$14.30	\$15.34	\$19.82	\$16.15
F.O.B. Chesaning Garage (2000 ton approx)	\$16.70	\$17.39	\$24.57	\$19.10
F.O.B. Hemlock Garage (2000 ton approx)	\$15.85	\$15.84	\$23.05	\$17.60
F.O.B. Albee Twp.	\$15.65	\$16.75	\$21.60	\$17.60
F.O.B. Birch Run Twp.	\$15.75	\$16.75	\$22.13	\$17.70
F.O.B. Blumfield Twp.	\$14.65	\$15.34	\$18.55	\$16.60
F.O.B. Brady Twp.	\$17.15	\$18.74	\$25.28	\$19.10
F.O.B. Brant Twp.	\$16.95	\$18.84	\$24.16	\$18.90
F.O.B. Bridgeport Twp.	\$14.65	\$15.95	\$20.38	\$16.60
F.O.B. Buena Vista Twp.	\$14.20	\$14.99	\$18.77	\$16.15
F.O.B. Carrollton Twp.	\$14.20	\$14.99	\$18.63	\$16.15
F.O.B. Chapin Twp.	\$17.55	\$19.45	\$26.15	\$19.60
F.O.B. Chesaning Twp.	\$17.15	\$18.85	\$23.88	\$19.10
F.O.B. Frankenmuth Twp.	\$15.65	\$16.90	\$21.36	\$17.60
F.O.B. Fremont Twp.	\$16.00	\$17.45	\$22.93	\$17.95
F.O.B. James Twp.	\$14.75	\$16.09	\$20.34	\$16.70
F.O.B. Jonesfield Twp.	\$16.00	\$17.25	\$22.55	\$17.95
F.O.B. Kochville Twp.	\$14.65	\$14.10	\$18.10	\$16.60
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp.	\$16.85	\$18.01	\$23.95	\$18.80
F.O.B. Maple Grove Twp.	\$15.90	\$17.15	\$22.76	\$17.85
F.O.B. Marion Twp.	\$17.15	\$18.85	\$25.10	\$19.10
F.O.B. Richland Twp.	\$15.90	\$17.25	\$21.74	\$17.85
F.O.B. Saginaw Twp.	\$14.75	\$15.09	\$19.54	\$16.70
F.O.B. St. Charles Twp.	\$16.00	\$17.20	\$22.97	\$17.95
F.O.B. Spaulding Twp.	\$15.05	\$17.05	\$20.34	\$17.00
F.O.B. Swan Creek Twp.	\$15.65	\$17.15	\$21.74	\$17.60
F.O.B. Taymouth Twp.	\$15.65	\$17.25	\$21.57	\$17.60
F.O.B. Thomas Twp.	\$15.15	\$15.84	\$20.34	\$17.10
F.O.B. Tittabawassee Twp.	\$15.15	\$15.84	\$19.36	\$17.10
F.O.B. Zilwaukee Twp.	\$14.65	\$14.99	\$18.17	\$16.60

Saginaw County Road Commission
2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

Proposal No. 31 - Aggregate 31A

Bidder's Name	Chesaning Garage - Material & Trucking	Hemlock Garage - Material & Trucking	Saginaw Co. Road Garage - Material & Trucking	Geddes Road Pit - Material & Trucking	Curtis Road Pit - Material & Trucking
Specification Stone Products 1009 Long Lake Ave Alpena, MI 49707 989-667-4336	\$21.40 ***Note this quote is for alternate material 29A Limestone in place of	\$19.85	\$19.35	\$19.85	\$19.85
WIRT Saginaw Stone Dock 4700 Crow Island Road Saginaw, MI 48601 989-753-6404	\$20.72	\$19.87	\$18.32	\$19.37	\$19.37
Fisher Transportation Company Inc 900 S. Bradley Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858 989-773-1376	\$29.63	\$27.85	\$24.08	\$25.63	\$25.41
Burroughs North 1701 N. 1st Street Saginaw, MI 48601 989-753-6404	\$22.35	\$20.85	\$19.50	\$20.50	\$20.50

Proposal No. 32 - Grass Seed

Bidder's Name	Type #1 Seed Mixture	Type #2 Seed Mixture
SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street Cleveland, Ohio 44114 216-706-9250 ext 2550	\$1.66	\$1.66
Hanes Geo Components 38160 Amrhein Livonia, MI 48150 248-321-4448	\$1.47 or \$73.50 /50# bag	\$1.45 or \$72.50 /50# bag

Proposal No. 33 - Fertilizer

Bidder's Name	19-0-19	12-0-12
Hanes Geo Components 38160 Amrhein Livonia, MI 48150 248-321-4448	\$0.178 or \$8.92/ 50# Bag	\$0.154 or \$7.70/ 50# Bag

Saginaw County Road Commission
2017 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations

Proposal No. 34 - Hydro-Mulch

Bidder's Name	Brand Name	Price Per Pound
SiteOne Landscape Supply 1385 East 36th Street Cleveland, Ohio 44114 216-706-9250 ext 2550	Applegate Hydro-Lok	\$0.18
Hanes Geo Components 38160 Amrhein Livonia, MI 48150 248-321-4448	GeoPro Basis Plus	\$0.182 or 9.12/ 50# Bale

**Proposal No. 35 - Raised
Thermoplastic Rumble Strips**

Bidder's Name	Pay Unit Foot
P.K. Contracting 6344 W. Blue Rd Lake City, MI 49651	\$7.00