
Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

BLANKS

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

Vulcan, Inc.                       
PO Box 1850                      

Foley, AL  36536-1850               
888-846-2745                      

MDSolutions                   
8225 Estetes Pkwy.             

Plain City, OH  43064            
614-873-2222

Mandel Metals, Inc.          
DBA US Standard Sign       
11400 W. Addison Ave.       
Franklin Park, IL  60131       

847-447-2232               
Does Not Meet Specs.

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
48" x 24" $17.20 $17.89 $16.88 $1.80
36" x 36" $19.35 $19.15 $18.99 $1.75
36" x 30" $16.12 $16.04 $15.83 $1.75
36" x 12" $6.45 $6.49 $6.33 $1.85
30" x 30" $13.48 $13.91 $13.19 $1.95
24" x 30" $10.75 $10.58 $10.55 $1.95
24" x 18" $6.45 $6.40 $6.33 $1.66
18" x 18" $4.83 $4.79 $4.75 $1.66
12" x 18" $3.22 $3.20 $3.17 $1.55
12" x 12" $2.15 $2.44 $2.35 $1.45
18" x 6" $1.61 $1.63 $1.80 $1.66
36" x 9" $4.83 $4.93 $4.95 $1.45
30" x 9" $4.02 $4.33 $4.14 $1.45
24" x 9" $3.22 $3.47 $3.17 $1.45
36" x 6" $3.22 $3.35 $3.45 $1.45
30" x 6" $2.68 $2.95 $2.89 $1.45
24" x 6" $2.15 $2.38 $2.31 $1.45
60" x 18" $16.12 $16.04 $15.83 $1.45
60" x 24" $21.50 $22.34 $21.10 $1.45
48" x 18" $12.90 $13.50 $12.66 $1.45
48"x 24" $17.20 $17.89 $16.88 $1.80

STOP BLANKS

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

Vulcan, Inc.                       
PO Box 1850                      

Foley, AL  36536-1850               
888-846-2745                      

MDSolutions                   
8225 Estetes Pkwy.             

Plain City, OH  43064            
614-873-2222

Mandel Metals, Inc.          
DBA US Standard Sign       
11400 W. Addison Ave.       
Franklin Park, IL  60131       

847-447-2232               
Does Not Meet Specs.

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 36" $17.40 $16.93 $18.63 $1.66

30" x 30" $12.07 $12.39 $12.94 $1.90

ROUND BLANKS - R.R. ADVANCE

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

Vulcan, Inc.                       
PO Box 1850                      

Foley, AL  36536-1850               
888-846-2745                      

MDSolutions                   
8225 Estetes Pkwy.             

Plain City, OH  43064            
614-873-2222

Mandel Metals, Inc.          
DBA US Standard Sign       
11400 W. Addison Ave.       
Franklin Park, IL  60131       

847-447-2232               
Does Not Meet Specs.

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" $16.46 $47.04 $18.80 $1.45

Proposal No. 8 – Highway Traffic Signs - Aluminum Blanks



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Series 3930 

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
12" x 36" $4.14 $5.52
24" x 42" $9.66 $15.40
30" x 30" $8.62 $11.50
12" x 18" $2.07 $2.85
30" x 36" $10.35 $16.50
30" x 18" $5.17 $8.25
48" x 24" $11.04 $17.60
24" x 30" $6.90 $10.50
24" x 24" $5.52 $8.40
24" x 18" $4.14 $6.30
12" x 12" $1.38 $2.45
18" x 6" $1.03 $1.85
48" x 30" $13.80 $21.00
36" x 36" $12.42 $12.45

Series 3930 

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" x 30" $8.62 $11.50

36" x 36" $12.42 $18.45

24" x 24" $5.52 $8.90

24" x 30" $6.90 $10.50

12" x 18" $2.07 $2.85

30" x 36" $10.35 $16.50

30" x 18" $5.17 $8.25

36" STOP AHEAD $15.87 $18.15

36" SIGNAL AHEAD $15.87 $18.15

36" x 48" x 48" NO PASSING ZONE $12.91 $18.45

48" x 24" $11.04 $17.60

12" x 36" $4.14 $5.52

24" x 18" $4.14 $6.30

24" x 42" $9.66 $15.40

12" x 12" $1.38 $2.45

18" x 6" $1.03 $1.85

48" x 30" $13.80 $21.00

36" YIELD AHEAD $15.87 $18.15

36" ROUND $12.42 $18.45

30" x 12" $3.45 $5.38

Proposal No. 9 – Highway Traffic Signs



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Series 4084 

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" DIAMOND $22.68 $28.94

48" DIAMOND $58.08 $74.08

48" x 18" $21.78 $27.78

36" DIAMOND $32.67 $41.67

30" x 24" $18.15 $23.15

Series 4083

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" DIAMOND $32.67 $41.67

30" x 12" $9.07 $11.68

30" x 18" $13.61 $17.51

24" x 8" $4.82 $6.23

24" x 12" $7.26 $9.34

Series 4000

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" STOP $42.97 $56.63

36" STOP $61.90 $81.54

Series 4000

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" STOP $46.93 $56.52

30" STOP $32.58 $39.25

36" YIELD $24.49 $29.75

18" x 6"   ALL-WAY $4.33 $4.97



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Series 3930

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face

36" x 48" x 48"   NO PASSING ZONE $21.30 $36.94

36"   ROUND ADVANCE RAILROAD $28.98 $36.94

Series 4083

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36"  SCHOOL $44.88 $56.52

36"   DIAMOND $48.66 $62.75

Series 3930

Dornbos Sign & Safety, Inc.       
619 W. Harris St.                 

Charlotte, MI  48813              
517-543-4000

MDSolutions                      
8225 Estetes Pkwy.                 

Plain City, OH  43064               
614-873-2222

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
24" x 6" $5.45 $11.06

30" x 6" $6.81 $13.83

36" x 6" $8.17 $16.59

24" x 9" $8.17 $16.59

30" x 9" $10.19 $20.74

36" x 9" $12.26 $24.89

ITEM 1 - CMP

Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands
12”  $                                                 5.10  $                                                      6.10  $                                               8.93  N/A  N/A 
15”  $                                                 6.10  $                                                      7.78  $                                               9.85  N/A  N/A 
18”  $                                                 7.90  $                                                      9.24  $                                             13.30  N/A  N/A 
21”  $                                                 8.90  $                                                    11.95  $                                             15.20  N/A  N/A 
24”  $                                                 9.95  $                                                    13.25  $                                             18.40  N/A  N/A 
30”  $                                               13.25  $                                                    16.45  $                                             21.25  N/A  N/A 

36”  $                                               17.25  $                                                    20.95  $                                             26.40  $                                      39.00  N/A 

42”  $                                               21.80  $                                                    24.00  $                                             31.35  $                                      45.00  N/A 

48”  $                                               25.00  $                                                    28.75  $                                             37.00  $                                      51.00  N/A 

54”  $                                               30.00  $                                                    37.50  $                                             43.95  $                                      58.00  N/A 

Proposal No. 11 – Metal Culvert Pipe and Bands 

Cadillac Culverts, Inc.  5305 Highway M-115, Cadillac, MI  49601    231-775-3761

 12" Wide = 1.65' of 
pipe               

24" wide = 2' of pipe 



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands
12”  $                                                 5.20  $                                                      6.48  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      10.00 

15”  $                                                 6.20  $                                                      8.10  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      12.00 

18”  $                                                 7.99  $                                                      9.75  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      14.00 

21”  $                                               10.00  $                                                    12.96  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      18.50 

24”  $                                               10.00  $                                                    12.96  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      18.50 

30”  $                                               12.75  $                                                    16.75  $                                             29.15  N/A  N/A  $                      33.50 

36”  $                                               15.75  $                                                    21.30  $                                             34.80  N/A  N/A  $                      42.60 

42”  $                                               20.75  $                                                    25.75  $                                             37.05  N/A  N/A  $                      51.50 

48”  $                                                        24.10  $                                                    29.45  $                                             37.80  N/A  N/A  $                      75.60 

54”  N/A  $                                                    38.40  $                                             51.89  $                                      83.75  N/A  $                    103.80 

Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands
12”  $                                                 5.15  $                                                      6.61  $                                               8.85  N/A  N/A  $                        7.72 

15”  $                                                 6.20  $                                                      8.24  $                                               9.98  N/A  N/A  $                        9.30 

18”  $                                                 8.00  $                                                      9.80  $                                             13.40  N/A  N/A  $                      12.00 

21”  $                                                 9.00  $                                                    11.43  $                                             15.20  N/A  N/A  $                      13.50 

24”  $                                               10.00  $                                                    13.30  $                                             19.61  N/A  N/A  $                      15.00 

30”  $                                               13.20  $                                                    16.54  $                                             22.63  $                                      30.36  N/A  $                      28.99 

36”  $                                               16.89  $                                                    21.00  $                                             34.37  $                                      36.51  N/A  $                      36.75 

42”  $                                               19.86  $                                                    24.03  $                                             31.38  $                                      42.67  N/A  $                      42.05 

48”  $                                               22.95  $                                                    27.69  $                                             37.00  $                                      48.85  $                                    58.27  $                      74.00 

54”  $                                               30.31  $                                                    35.81  $                                             45.73  $                                      57.61  $                                    68.02  $                      91.46 

ITEM 2 - Poly-Coated CMP

Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands Lifting Lugs
12”  $                                                 7.24  $                                                      8.66  $                                             12.68  N/A  N/A $30.00/Set
15”  $                                                 8.66  $                                                    11.05  $                                             13.99  N/A  N/A 
18”  $                                               11.22  $                                                    13.12  $                                             18.89  N/A  N/A 
21”  $                                               12.64  $                                                    16.97  $                                             21.58  N/A  N/A 
24”  $                                               14.13  $                                                    18.82  $                                             26.13  N/A  N/A 
30”  $                                               18.82  $                                                    23.36  $                                             30.18  N/A  N/A 

36”  $                                               24.50  $                                                    29.75  $                                             37.48  N/A  N/A 

42”  $                                               30.96  $                                                    34.08  $                                             44.52  N/A  N/A 

48”  $                                               35.50  $                                                    40.83  $                                             52.54  N/A  N/A 

54”  $                                               42.60  $                                                    53.25  $                                             62.41  N/A  N/A 

Jensen Bridge & Supply Company, 400 Stoney Creek Dr., PO Box 151, Sandusky, MI  48471       810-648-3000

Cadillac Culverts, Inc.  5305 Highway M-115, Cadillac, MI  49601    231-775-3761

 12" Wide = 1.65' of 
pipe               

24" wide = 2' of pipe 

St. Regis Culvert, Inc., 202 Morrell St., Charlotte, MI  48813               800-527-4604



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands Lifting Lugs
12”  $                                                 7.75  $                                                      9.72  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      13.60 $45.00/Ea.

15”  $                                                 9.30  $                                                    12.15  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      16.30 

18”  $                                               11.65  $                                                    14.60  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      20.40 

21”  $                                               14.45  $                                                    17.45  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      25.80 

24”  $                                               14.75  $                                                    19.45  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      25.80 

30”  $                                               19.20  $                                                    24.30  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      48.60 

36”  $                                               23.10  $                                                    29.16  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      58.30 

42”  $                                               27.25  $                                                    34.02  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      68.04 

48”  $                                               30.30  $                                                    38.88  $                                             52.65  N/A  N/A  $                      77.80 

54”  N/A  $                                                    43.75  $                                             59.15  $                                      92.00  N/A  $                    118.30 

Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands Lifting Lugs
12”  $                                                 8.02  $                                                      9.67  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      12.03 $50.25/Ea.

15”  $                                                 9.81  $                                                    12.00  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      14.71 

18”  $                                               11.74  $                                                    14.33  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      17.61 

21”  $                                               13.58  $                                                    16.63  N/A  N/A  N/A  $                      20.37 

24”  $                                               15.50  $                                                    18.95  $                                             28.42  N/A  N/A  $                      23.25 

30”  $                                               19.29  $                                                    23.60  $                                             33.28  N/A  N/A  $                      41.30 

36”  $                                               23.06  $                                                    30.03  $                                             40.54  N/A  N/A  $                      52.55 

42”  $                                               26.85  $                                                    33.23  $                                             47.04  $                                      65.45  N/A  $                      58.15 

48”  $                                               32.98  $                                                    39.90  $                                             52.10  $                                      75.60  N/A  $                      79.80 

54”  $                                               39.82  $                                                    47.37  $                                             61.02  $                                      85.90  N/A  $                      94.74 

St. Regis Culvert, Inc., 202 Morrell St., Charlotte, MI  48813               800-527-4604

Jensen Bridge & Supply Company, 400 Stoney Creek Dr., PO Box 151, Sandusky, MI  48471       810-648-3000



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Bidder’s Name Price/Cu. Yard Free Delivery Zone Add Price per Cubic Yard per mile 
past free delivery Zone

Add Price per Cubic Yard at 
or after 3:00 pm

Add Price per Cubic Yard 
Saturday

Free Unloading 
Time Dummerage

Add Price per Cubic 
Yard Chloride 

Concrete

NO BIDDERS

Bidder’s Name  5 Sack per cu. Yard 9 Sack per cu. yard Price Per Cubic Yard
NO BIDDERS

Bidder’s Name 5 Sack 9 Sack Price Per Cubic Yard
NO BIDDERS

Bidder’s Name 5 Sack 9 Sack Price Per Cubic Yard
NO BIDDERS

Bidder’s Name 5 Sack 9 Sack Price Per Cubic Yard
NO BIDDERS

Bidder’s Name 5 Sack 9 Sack Price Per Cubic Yard
NO BIDDERS

Bidder's Name Route, Clean & Seal with Hot 
Poured Rubber

Clean & Seal with Hot Poured Rubber 
OVER BAND Method

Fahrner Asphalt Sealers, LLC              
2224 Veterans Memorial Pkwy.             

Saginaw, MI  48601                       
989-752-9200

$1.352 $1.121

Wolverine Sealcoating & Asphalt Maint.            
545 Shirley Drive                               

Jackson, MI  49202                             
517-962-4261      517-745-1390

$1.40 $1.13

Interstate Sealant & Concrete, Inc.          
S40 W24211 Rockwood Way               

Waukesha, WI  53189                     
262-547-6316

$1.00 $0.40
Materials Only                  

Eqt. Rental Extra                
Does Not Meet Specifications

Scodeller Construction                   
51722 Grand River                       
Wixom, MI  48393                        

248-374-1102

No Bid $1.34

Proposal #14 Ready Mix Concrete - Wet or Dry

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 4 to 5 Yards

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 2 to 3 Yards

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 3 to 4 Yards

Proposal #16 Crack Sealing

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County Under 2 Yards

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites – Saginaw County 5 Yards and Over

F.O.B. County Trucks at Plant – 4½ Sack



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Bidder's Name F.O.B. County Trucks F.O.B. Saginaw Storage Yard F.O.B. Hemlock Storage Yard F.O.B. Chesaning Storage 
Yard

Unique Paving Materials                  
3993 E. 93rd St.                          

Cleveland, OH  44105                     
231-266-8090

$89.00 $92.25 $93.75 $96.05

Bidders Name F.O.B. County Trucks 
Unique Paving Materials                  

3993 E. 93rd St.                          
Cleveland, OH  44105                     

231-266-8090

N/A

Bidders Name Topsoil 3" Depth                 
(Per Sq. Yd) Unit Price Per Sq. Yd.

Rodney Woods Builder                   
2300 S. Thomas Rd.                      
Saginaw, MI  48609                       

989-280-3069                            
517-404-2664

$6.50 $6.85

SiteOne Landscape Supply                
1385 East 36th Street                     
Cleveland, OH  44114                     

216-706-9250

No Bid No Bid

Bidder's Name

Michigan Paving & Materials       
1950 Williams St.                
Alma, MI  48801                  

989-402-5932

Asphalt Materials, Inc.              
940 N. Wynn Rd.                   

Oregon, OH  43616                 
419-693-0626

HFRS-2M                               
F.O.B. Shipping Point $1.63 $1.700

HFRS-2M                               
F.O.B. Job Site $1.68 $1.7768

HFRS-2                                 
F.O.B.  Shipping Point $1.43 $1.500

HFRS-2 F.O.B.                           
Job Site $1.48 $1.5768

Demurrage $90.00/Hr. $90.00/Hr.

Chiplock                                
F.O.B. Shipping Point

1.20 - (QTF Seal instead of Chip 
Lock) No Bid

Chiplock                                
F.O.B. Job Site

1.25 - (QTF Seal instead of Chip 
Lock) No Bid

Fogseal
1.20 Delivered                   

1.15 Shipping Point               
(CSS - 1h Dilute)

$1.5768

Item 2 - Hot Mix Bituminous Materials Material No. 1100T (20AA)

Proposal No. 18- Topsoil & Seeding

Proposal No. 19- Asphalt Emulsions

Proposal No. 17- Bituminous Patching Materials (Cold Patch)  -  BID REJECTED - WILL RE-BID
Item No. 1 - Styrelf Emulsion Based CP-6



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Pep-Dilute No Bid No Bid

Bidder’s Name Removal & Replace (including 
excavation) New (not including excavation) New (including excavation)

Agnew Construction Company             
4097 Pierce Rd.                          

Saginaw, MI  48604                       
989-751-3168

$43.00 $40.00 $40.00

Allen Contracting Services, Inc.            
PO Box 1464                            

1100 Cranbrook                         
Saginaw, MI  48605-1464                  

989-790-4933

$25.50 20.50 $25.50

Rodney Woods Builder                   
2300 S. Thomas Rd.                      
Saginaw, MI  48609                       

989-280-3069                            
517-404-2664

$36.00 24.00 $32.00

Mid Michigan Contracting, Inc.             
5563 Dixie Hwy.                          

Saginaw, MI  48601                       
989-799-1004

$25.00 25.00 $25.00

Bidder’s Name Price per Inch Price per Hour

Chop Tree Service                       
1505 Steel Ave. S.W.                      

Grand Rapids, MI  49507                  
616-583-9821

$3.00 No Bid

Heinz Tree Service, Inc.                   
880 Kochville Rd.                        

Saginaw, MI  48604                       
989-754-8009

$3.00 $225.00

Mid Michigan Contracting, Inc.             
5563 Dixie Hwy.                          

Saginaw, MI  48601                       
989-799-1004

$0.85 $85.00

Jameson Tree Removal                   
3900 River Rd.                           

Freeland, MI  48623                       
989-225-5850

$0.80 $75.00

Proposal No. 21 – Curb & Gutter Removal & Replacement

Proposal No. 22 – Stump Removal



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Bidder’s Name Geddes Road Borrow Pit Curtis Road Borrow Pit Chesaning Garage Hemlock Garage S.C.R.C. Garage Pick-up By Rd. 
Comm. Trucks

Rodney Woods Builder                   
2300 S. Thomas Rd.                      
Saginaw, MI  48609                       

989-280-3069                            
517-404-2664

$9.50 $10.75 $10.00 $9.50 $10.75 $14.00

Burroughs North                         
1701 N. 1st St.                           
PO Box  3252                            

Saginaw, MI  48605                       
989-399-1007

$13.25 $12.00 $13.25 $13.40 $12.25 $12.25

Bunting Sand & Gravel Products Inc.        
3247 Cook Rd.                           

PO Box 217                             
West Branch, MI  48661                   

989-345-2373

$12.10 $10.95 $13.45 $12.10 $10.95 $4.75

Steve Krupp Trucking                    
2516 Peet Rd.                           

New Lothrop, MI   48460                   
989-860-7550

$9.00 $11.00 $7.25 $9.25 $11.50 No Bid

Bidder’s Name % - Price per Gallon Lead Time Storage Price to Chesaning Storage Price to Hemlock Storage Pice to Saginaw Storage Price to 
Chesaning

Storage Price to 
Hemlock

Storage Pice to 
Saginaw

Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC              
402 W. Jackson Rd.                      
St. Louis, MI  48880                      

989-681-3221

26%   -    $0.1587 12-24 Hours $0.1887 $0.1887 $0.1887 $0.1487 $0.1487 $0.1487

Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales             
2715 S. Huron Rd.                        

Kawkawlin, MI  48631                     
989-684-5860

38%   -   $0.536 24 - 48 Hours $0.467 $0.467 $0.467 $0.417 $0.417 $0.417

SiteOne Landscape Supply                
1385 East 36th Street                     
Cleveland, OH  44114                     

216-706-9250

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

WINTER BRINE ONLY
Proposal No. 25 – Calcium Magnesium Chloride Solution

Proposal No. 24 – Bituminous Sand - 2NS

WINTER BRINE WITH STORAGE TANKSSUMMER BRINE GRAVEL ROADS



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Bidder's Name Quantity (Estimated) 1000 SFT

Asphalt Concrete Service                 
2715 S. Huron Rd.                        

Kawkawlin, MI  48631                     
989-684-9146

0.79

Asphalt Bituminous Concrete              
6908 Westside Saginaw Rd.               

Bay City, MI  48706                       
989-695-5352

1.08

M & M Pavement Marking, Inc.             
PO Box 530                             

Grand Blanc, MI  48480                   
810-695-4833

0.75

Bidder's Name Quantity (Estimated) 1000 SFT

Asphalt Concrete Service                 
2715 S. Huron Rd.                        

Kawkawlin, MI  48631                     
989-684-9146

1.18

Asphalt Bituminous Concrete              
6908 Westside Saginaw Rd.               

Bay City, MI  48706                       
989-695-5352

1.10

M & M Pavement Marking, Inc.             
PO Box 530                             

Grand Blanc, MI  48480                   
810-695-4833

0.90

Proposal No. 27 – Pavement Marking - Symbols
Item No. 1 -  Remove Existing Markings

Item No. 2 -  Regular Dry Pavement Markings (PAINT NEW SYMBOLS)



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Bidder's Name Quantity (Estimated) 5260 SFT

Asphalt Concrete Service                 
2715 S. Huron Rd.                        

Kawkawlin, MI  48631                     
989-684-9146

1.03

Asphalt Bituminous Concrete              
6908 Westside Saginaw Rd.               

Bay City, MI  48706                       
989-695-5352

0.93

M & M Pavement Marking, Inc.             
PO Box 530                             

Grand Blanc, MI  48480                   
810-695-4833

0.90

Bidder's Name

M & M Pavement Marking, Inc.     
PO Box 530                     

Grand Blanc, MI  48480           
810-695-4833

P.K. Contracting                   
6344 W. Blue Rd.                   

Lake City, MI  49651                

 Labor & Equipment                      
(Price Per Foot) $0.0013 $0.0409

*Paint & Beads                          
(Price Per Foot) $0.038 No Bid

Bidder's Name

M & M Pavement Marking, Inc.     
PO Box 530                     

Grand Blanc, MI  48480           
810-695-4833

P.K. Contracting                   
6344 W. Blue Rd.                   

Lake City, MI  49651                

Labor & Equipment                       
(Price Per Foot) $0.0010 $0.040

*Paint & Beads                          
(Price Per Foot) $0.0380 No Bid

Bidder's Name

M & M Pavement Marking, Inc.     
PO Box 530                     

Grand Blanc, MI  48480           
810-695-4833

P.K. Contracting                   
6344 W. Blue Rd.                   

Lake City, MI  49651                

Labor & Equipment                       
(Price Per Foot) $0.002 $0.054

*Paint & Beads                          
(Prince Per Foot) $0.049 No Bid

Item No. 2 -  ± 3,200,000 Ft. White Line as directed

Item No. 3 - Yellow Regular Dry Solvent (Fall Quantities Unknown)

Item No. 1 -  ± 1,400,000 Ft. Yellow Line as directed
Proposal No. 28 - Pavement Marking, Cold Applied

Item No. 3 - Regular Dry Pavement Marking (REPAINT EXISTING SYMBOLS)



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Bidder's Name

M & M Pavement Marking, Inc.     
PO Box 530                     

Grand Blanc, MI  48480           
810-695-4833

P.K. Contracting                   
6344 W. Blue Rd.                   

Lake City, MI  49651                

Labor & Equipment                       
(Price Per Foot) $0.002 $0.048

*Paint & Beads                          
(Price Per Foot) $0.049 No Bid

Bidder's Name Type #1 Seed Mixture Type #2 Seed Mixture

SiteOne Landscape Supply                
1385 East 36th Street                     
Cleveland, OH  44114                     

216-706-9250

$1.565 $1.786

CSI Geoturf Inc.                         
PO Box 668                             

Highland, MI  48357                      
248-887-6767

$1.65 $1.53

Hanes Geo Components                  
38160 Amrhein Rd. - Bldg. 3E              

Livonia, MI  48150                        
248-321-4448

$1.49 $1.47

Bidder's Name 19-0-19 12-0-12

SiteOne Landscape Supply                
1385 East 36th Street                     
Cleveland, OH  44114                     

216-706-9250

$0.282                          
19-19-19 No Bid

CSI Geoturf Inc.                         
PO Box 668                             

Highland, MI  48357                      
248-887-6767

$0.192 $0.156

Hanes Geo Components                  
38160 Amrhein Rd. - Bldg. 3E              

Livonia, MI  48150                        
248-321-4448

$0.179 $0.135

Item No. 4 - White Regular Dry Solvent (Fall Quantities Unknown)

Proposal No. 32 -  Grass Seed

Proposal No. 33 -  Fertilizer



Saginaw County Road Commission 
2016 Annual Maintenance Bid Tabulations 

Bidder's Name Brand Name Price Per Pound
SiteOne Landscape Supply                

1385 East 36th Street                     
Cleveland, OH  44114                     

216-706-9250

Hydrocover Cellulose $0.176

CSI Geoturf Inc.                         
PO Box 668                             

Highland, MI  48357                      
248-887-6767

Geoturf $0.182

Hanes Geo Components                  
38160 Amrhein Rd. - Bldg. 3E              

Livonia, MI  48150                        
248-321-4448

GeoPro Basis Plus w/Tac $0.157

Bidder's Name Pay Unit Foot

P.K. Contracting                         
6344 W. Blue Rd.                         

Lake City, MI  49651                      
No Bid

Proposal No. 34 -  Hydro-Mulch

Proposal No. 35 -  Raised Thermoplastic Rumble Strips  -  BID REJECTED - WILL RE-BID


