BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 8 — Highway Traffic Signs - Aluminum Blanks

BLANKS Michigan State Industries Dornbos Sign Company
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
48" x 24" $26.00 $25.06
36" x 36" $29.25 $28.19
36" x 30" $24.38 $23.49
36" x 12" $9.75 $10.18
30" x 30" $20.31 $19.58
24" x 30" $16.25 $15.66
24" x 18" $9.75 $10.18
18" x 18" $7.31 $7.63
12" x 18" $4.88 $5.48
12" x 12" $3.25 $3.65

18" x 6" $2.44 $3.04
36" x 9" $7.31 $7.63
30" x 9" $6.09 $6.38
24" x 9" S4.76 $5.09
36" x 6" $4.88 $5.09
30" x 6" $3.96 $4.57
24" x 6" $3.25 $3.65
60" x 18" $24.38 $23.49
60" x 24" $32.50 $31.32
48" x 18" $19.50 $18.79
48"x 24" $26.00 $25.06
36" x 18" $14.63 $14.09
30" x 18" $12.19 $11.75

STOP BLANKS

Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 36" $29.25 $28.19
30" x 30" $20.31 $19.58
ROUND BLANKS -
R.R. ADVANCE
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" $29.25 $28.19
36"x48"x48" $39.00 $25.20




BID TABULATION

Proposal No. 9 — Highway Traffic Sighs

Series 3930 Michigan State Industries Dornbos Sign Company
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
12" x 36" $4.50 $5.48
24" x 42" $10.50 $10.46
30" x 30" $9.38 $9.34
12" x 18" $2.25 $3.74
30" x 36" $11.25 $11.21
30" x 18" $5.63 $6.60
48" x 24" $12.00 $11.96
30" STOPS $9.38 $9.34
36" STOPS $13.50 $13.45
24" x 30" $7.50 $7.97
24" x 24" $6.00 $6.73
24" x 18" $4.50 $5.48
12" x 12" $1.50 $3.49

18" x 6" $1.13 $2.87
48" x 30" $15.00 $14.94
36" x 36" $13.50 $13.45

Series 3930
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" x 30" $9.38 $9.34
36" x 36" $13.50 $13.45
24" x 24" $6.00 $6.73
24" x 30" $7.50 $7.97
12" x 18" $2.25 S3.74
30" x 36" $11.25 $11.21
30" x 18" $5.63 $6.60

36" STOP AHEAD $16.50 $18.68
36" SIGNAL AHEAD $16.50 $18.68
36" x 48" x 48" NO

$18.00 $10.97

PASSING ZONE

48" x 24" $12.00 $11.96
12" x 36" $4.50 $5.48
24" x 18" $4.50 $5.48
24" x 42" $10.50 $10.46
12" x 12" $1.50 $3.49
18" x 6" $1.13 $2.87
48" x 30" $15.00 $14.94

36" YIELD AHEAD $13.50 $18.68

36" ROUND $13.50 $13.45
30" x 12" $3.75 $4.99

Series 4084
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face

30" DIAMOND $19.69 $19.51
48" DIAMOND $50.14 $70.86
48" x 18" $18.90 $18.73
36" DIAMOND $28.35 $28.09
30" x 24" $15.75 $15.61




Series 4083 Michigan State Industries Dornbos Sign Company
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" DIAMOND $28.35 $27.74
30" x 12" $7.88 $7.95
30" x 18" $11.81 S11.56
24" x 8" $4.20 $5.13
24" x 12" $6.30 $6.66
Series 4000
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" STOP $38.12 $52.65
36" STOP $54.90 $75.82
Series 4000
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" STOP $59.85 $58.80
30" STOP $41.56 $40.83
36" YIELD $59.85 $29.40
18" x 6" ALL-WAY $4.58 $5.90

Series 3930
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 48" x 48" NO
60.00 7
PASSING ZONE > EEIE
36" ROUND ADVANCE
$45.00 S44.52
RAILROAD
Series 4083
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" SCHOOL $54.90 $58.80
36" DIAMOND $54.90 $58.80
Series 3930
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
24" x 6" $6.00 $7.01
30" x 6" $7.50 $8.77
36" x 6" $9.00 $10.52
24" x 9" $9.00 $10.52
30" x 9" $11.25 $13.18
36" x 9" $13.50 $15.78




BID TABULATION:

Bid Date: 12.21.2023

Proposal #11 - Metal Culvert Pipe and Bands

Jensen Bridge and Supply Co.

Pipe

Item #1 Diameter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge
CMP

12" $ 1118|$ 1451[$ 2017 N/A N/A
15" $ 1449|$ 1799 [$ 2265 N/A N/A
18" S 17.25| S 2151 $ 30.75 N/A N/A
21" S 2072 |$ 2512 (S 34.80 N/A N/A
24" S 2281 |S 2871|S 4227 N/A N/A
30" S 2948 | S 3640 (| S  47.02 N/A N/A
36" $ 3658|S 4371|$ 57.72($ 8122 N/A
42" $ 4440|$ 51615 67.25|$  94.73 110.98
48" $ 50.92 [ $  59.06 | $ 77.31|$ 10821 130.26
54" $ 59.97 | $ 69.95|$ 90.05|$ 126.10 150.99
. Pipe 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge

Item #1 Diameter

CMP

12"
15"
18"
21"
24"
30"
42"
48"
54"

Bands

Bands 12" through 24" are 12"
wide

Bands 30" and above are 24"
wide

Bands

Jensen Bridge and Supply Co.

Item #2 Di:r::)eeter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands
Poly-coated CMP
12" $ 17.04|$ 2097 |$ 2829 N/A N/A
15" $ 2111($  2601|$ 3162 N/A N/A
18" $ 2526 (S 3105|$ 4280 N/A N/A
21" S 2924 (S 3606 |S 4821 N/A N/A
24" $ 3338(S$ 4109|$ 5845 N/A N/A
30" $ 4152($ 5115|$ 6841 N/A N/A
36" S  4965(S 6261|S 8226|S$ 106.55 N/A
42" $ 5779|$ 7173|$ 9611 [$ 12522 N/A
48" $ 6885|S 8431[$ 11155($ 14379 N/A
54" $ 8100($ 9786 |S$ 12833 |S$ 164.63 N/A
Bands 12" through 24" are
12" wide
Bands 30" and above are
24" wide
Lifting lugs: $100 each
(48" & 54" each)
Item #2 . Pipe 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands
Diameter
Poly-coated CMP
12"
15"
18"
21"
24"
30"
42"
48"
54"

Lifting Lugs:

$ each



BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 14 - CST© /Slag

Chesaning Hemlock Saginaw Co. |Geddes Road Pit . .
Curtis Road Pit -
] \ Garage - Garage - Road Garage - - ]
Bidder's Name _ - A . Material &
Material & Material & Material & Material & .
. ) ) . Trucking
Trucking Trucking Trucking Trucking

Fisher Transportation Co. $57.66 $55.50 $51.72 $52.80 $52.53




BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 15— C S 2 Trap Rock & 29A Limestone 50/50 Blend

Bidder’s Name

Burroughs North

Wirt Stone Dock

Chesaning Garage $38.75 $38.85
Hemlock Garage $36.85 $36.85
Saginaw Garage $35.50 $35.60
Geddes Rd. Pit $36.85 $36.60
Curtis Rd. Pit $36.00 $36.35
Pick-up by SCRC $31.00 $31.35
Albee Twp. $36.50 $36.60
Birch Run Twp. $36.75 $36.85
Blumfield Twp. $35.75 $35.85
Brady Twp. $38.75 $38.60
Brant Twp. $38.75 $38.60
Bridgeport Twp. $35.75 $35.85
Buena Vista Twp. $35.75 $35.60
Carrollton Twp. $35.75 $35.60
Chapin Twp. $40.25 $40.10
Chesaning Twp. $38.75 $38.60
Frankenmuth Twp. $36.35 $36.60
Fremont Twp. $38.00 $37.85
James Twp. $36.05 $36.10
Jonesfield Twp. $38.25 $38.10
Kochville Twp. $35.85 $35.85
Lakefield Twp. $38.50 $38.35
Maple Grove Twp. $37.75 $37.60
Marion Twp. $39.25 $39.10
Richland Twp. $38.75 $38.60
Saginaw Twp. $37.50 $36.10
St. Charles Twp. $36.25 $37.85
Spaulding Twp. $35.75 $36.10
Swan Creek Twp. $37.00 $36.85
Taymouth Twp. $37.00 $36.85
Thomas Twp. $36.50 $36.35
Titt. Twp. $36.50 $36.35
Zilwaukee Twp. $35.35 $35.60




BID TABULATION:

Proposal #16 Crack Sealing

Bidder's Name

Route, Clean & Seal with Hot
Poured Rubber

Clean & Seal with Hot Poured
Rubber OVER BAND Method

Wolverine Sealcoating $1.170 $1.160
Fahrner Asphalt Sealers $1.75 $1.55
National Industrial Maint. $2.64 $2.14




BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 17- Bituminous Patching Materials (Cold Patch)

ltem No. 1 - Styrelf Emulsion Based CP-6

F.O.B. F.O.B.
i , F.O.B. Saginaw F.O.B. Chesaning
Bidder's Name County Hemlock
Storage Yard Storage Yard
Trucks Storage Yard
Unique Paving Materials $125.00 $129.00 $132.10 $134.25
Ace - Saginaw Paving Co. $121.25 $124.50 $126.50 $128.00

Item 2 - Hot Mix Bituminous Materials Material No. 1100T (20AA)

F.O.B.

Bidders Name County
Trucks

Unique Paving Materials No Bid

Ace - Saginaw Paving Co. $72.50




BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 19- Asphalt Emulsions

(MPM) Michigan Paving &

Bidder's Name . Bit-Mat
Materials Co.
2.47 2.14
CRS-2M F.0.B. Shipping Point 2 2
CRS-2M F.O.B. Job Site $2.59 $2.18
Demurrage 110.00/hour 135.00/hour /hour
Chiplock F.O.B.
1.75 1.58
Shipping Point > 2
Chiplock
F.O.B. Job Site >1.87 e
F — -
ogseal . Shipping Point No Bid No Bid
Dilute
Fogseal F.0.B. Job Site No Bid No Bid
L ) No Bid
AMS Seal F.0.B Shipping Point $2.45
AMS Seal F.O.B SCRC Tank $3.35 No Bid




BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 20 — Roadside Vegetation Spraying

Item B: Brush

ltem A: Brush Control Item C: Guard | Item D: Cattail & Dept. of
Bidder's Name ) . Rail Vegetation Phragmites Agriculture ROW
Control (Sensitive >
Control Control License (Cat. 6)
Areas)
S. Imperial Services $0.99 $1.25 0.08 1.75 Yes

The Daltons Inc. $1.49 $1.99 $0.15 $2.25 Yes




BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 26 — Crushed Limestone — 23A

Bidder’s Name Burroughs North Wirt Stone Dock Fisher Transportation Co.
Loading Point (Location)
F.O.B. Loading Point $17.00 $17.65 No Bid
F.0.B. Saginaw Garage (4000 ton approx) $21.50 $21.90 $29.11
F.0.B. Chesaning Garage (2000 ton approx) $24.75 $25.15 $35.94
F.0.B. Hemlock Garage (2000 ton approx) $22.85 $23.15 $33.50
F.0.B. Albee Twp. $22.50 $22.90 $32.00
F.0.B. Birch Run Twp. $22.75 $23.15 $31.73
F.0.B. Blumfield Twp. $21.75 $22.15 $26.97
F.O.B. Brady Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $36.68
F.O.B. Brant Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $34.92
F.0.B. Bridgeport Twp. $21.75 $22.15 $28.98
F.0.B. Buena Vista Twp. $21.75 $21.90 $27.34
F.0.B. Carrollton Twp. $21.75 $21.90 $26.23
F.O.B. Chapin Twp. $26.25 $26.40 $38.05
F.0.B. Chesaning Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $34.48
F.0.B. Frankenmuth Twp. $22.35 $22.90 $30.52
F.0.B. Fremont Twp. $24.00 $24.15 $32.99
F.O0.B. James Twp. $22.05 $22.40 $28.92
F.O.B. Jonesfield Twp. $24.25 $24.40 $32.39
F.0.B. Kochville Twp. $21.85 $22.15 $26.18
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. $24.50 $24.65 $34.59
F.0.B. Maple Grove Twp. $23.75 $23.90 $32.72
F.0.B. Marion Twp. $25.25 $25.40 $36.40
F.0.B. Richland Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $31.12
F.O.B. Saginaw Twp. $23.50 $22.40 $28.68
F.O.B. St. Charles Twp. $22.25 $24.15 $33.05
F.0.B. Spaulding Twp. $21.75 $22.40 $28.92
F.0.B. Swan Creek Twp. $23.00 $23.15 $31.12
F.0.B. Taymouth Twp. $23.00 $23.15 $30.85
F.0.B. Thomas Twp. $22.50 $22.65 $28.92
F.O.B. Tittabawassee Twp. $22.50 $22.65 $28.38
F.0.B. Zilwaukee Twp. $21.35 $21.90 $26.30




Proposal No. 26 - Modified Crushed Limestone - 22A

Bidder’s Name

Burroughs North

Wirt Stone Dock

Fisher Transportation Co.

Loading Point (Location)

F.0.B. Loading Point $17.00 $17.65 No Bid
F.0.B. Saginaw Garage (4000 ton approx) $21.50 $21.90 $29.11
F.0.B. Chesaning Garage (2000 ton approx) $24.75 $25.15 $35.94
F.0.B. Hemlock Garage (2000 ton approx) $22.85 $23.15 $33.50
F.0.B. Albee Twp. $22.50 $22.90 $32.00
F.0.B. Birch Run Twp. $22.75 $23.15 $31.73
F.0.B. Blumfield Twp. $21.75 $22.15 $26.97
F.0.B. Brady Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $36.68
F.O.B. Brant Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $34.92
F.0.B. Bridgeport Twp. $21.75 $22.15 $28.98
F.0.B. Buena Vista Twp. $21.75 $21.90 $27.34
F.0.B. Carrollton Twp. $21.75 $21.90 $26.23
F.O.B. Chapin Twp. $26.25 $26.40 $38.05
F.0.B. Chesaning Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $34.48
F.0.B. Frankenmuth Twp. $22.35 $22.90 $30.52
F.0.B. Fremont Twp. $24.00 $24.15 $32.99
F.O0.B. James Twp. $22.05 $22.40 $28.92
F.O.B. Jonesfield Twp. $24.25 $24.40 $32.39
F.0.B. Kochville Twp. $21.85 $22.15 $26.18
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. $24.50 $24.65 $34.59
F.0.B. Maple Grove Twp. $23.75 $23.90 $32.72
F.0.B. Marion Twp. $25.25 $25.40 $36.40
F.0.B. Richland Twp. $24.75 $24.90 $31.12
F.O.B. Saginaw Twp. $23.50 $22.40 $28.68
F.O.B. St. Charles Twp. $22.25 $24.15 $33.05
F.0.B. Spaulding Twp. $21.75 $22.40 $28.92
F.0.B. Swan Creek Twp. $23.00 $23.15 $31.12
F.0.B. Taymouth Twp. $23.00 $23.15 $30.85
F.0.B. Thomas Twp. $22.50 $22.65 $28.92
F.O.B. Tittabawassee Twp. $22.50 $22.65 $28.38
F.0.B. Zilwaukee Twp. $21.35 $21.90 $26.30




BID TABULATION:

Item No. 1 - Remove Existing Markings

Bidder's Name

Quantity (Estimated) 1000 SFT

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

2.50

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

1.8

Item No. 2 - Regular Dry Pavement Markings (PAINT NEW SYMBOLS)

Bidder's Name

Quantity (Estimated) 1000 SFT

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

3.00

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

1.80

Item No. 3 - Regular Dry Pavement Marking (REPAINT EXISTING SYMBOLS)

Bidder's Name

Quantity (Estimated) 5260 SFT

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

3

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

1.8

Proposal No. 27 — Pavement Marking - Symbols

Total of tem #1 +2 +3

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

$8.50

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

$5.40




BID TABULATION:

Item #1 -
+ 1,400,000 Ft. Yellow Line
as directed

Proposal No. 28 - Line Striping

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

$0.06

No Bid

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

No Bid

$0.0580

Item #2 -
White Line as directed

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

$0.06

No Bid

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

No Bid

$0.0570

Iltem #3 -
Yellow Regular Dry Solvent
(Fall quantities unknown)

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

$0.10

No Bid

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

No Bid

$0.0680

Iltem #4 -
White Regular Dry Solvent
(Fall quantities unknown)

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)

(MPM) Michigan Pavement Markings LLC

$0.10

No Bid

M&M Pavement Marking, Inc.

No Bid

$0.0680




BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 32 - Grass Seed

Bidder's Name

Type #1 Seed Mixture

Type #2 Seed Mixture

Rhino Seed & Landscape Supply

3.10/lb

2.53/lb

Hanes Geo Components

2.11/lb

1.76/Ib




BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 33 - Fertilizer

Bidder's Name 19-0-19 12-0-12
Rhino Seed & Landscape Supply .50/1b .37/lb
Hanes Geo Components .339/Ib .299/1b

***For Rhino Seed & Landscape Supply:
19-0-19 is 19-19-19
12-0-12 is 12-12-12




BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 34 - Hydro-Mulch

Bidder's Name Brand Name Price Per Pound
Rhino Seed & Landscape Supply Profile Products 23.74/Bale
Hanes Geo Components Profile Paper 22.85/Bale




BID TABULATION:

PROPOSAL NO. 36 - MODIFIED NATURAL GRAVEL 23A

BIDDER le?rfuil?ier:’g&czf’ns Transpli:::raet:on Co.
F.O.B. Loading Point No Bid No Bid
F.O.B. Saginaw Garage
(1000 ton approx) 23.25 19.73
F.0.B. Chesaning Garage
(2000 ton approx)
16.7 16.4
F.O.B. Hemlock Garage
(2000 ton approx) 17.4 18.62
F.O.B. Albee Twp 18 No Bid
F.0.B. Birch Run Twp 20.7 No Bid
F.O.B. Blumfield 23.3 No Bid
F.O.B. Brady Twp. 15.9 17.54
F.O.B. Brant Twp. 16.28 18.15
F.O.B. Bridgeport Twp. 21.22 No Bid
F.O.B. Buena Vista Twp. 23.2 No Bid
F.O.B. Chapin Twp. 14.91 16.32
F.0.B. Chesaning Twp. 16.7 No Bid
F.O.B. Frankenmuth Twp. 21.7 No Bid
F.0.B. Fremont Twp. 17.32 19.98
F.O.B. James Twp. 19.2 No Bid
F.O.B. Jonesfield Twp. 18.31 19.98
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. 16.35 19.37
F.O.B. Maple Grove Twp. 18.2 No Bid
F.O.B. Marion Twp. 16.4 18.15
F.O.B. Richland Twp. 18.7 21.81
F.O.B. St. Charles Twp. 18 No Bid
F.O.B. Spaulding Twp. 19.98 No Bid
F.0.B. Swan Creek Twp. 18.39 No Bid
F.0.B. Taymouth Twp. 19.98 No Bid
F.0.B. Thomas Twp. 19.53 No Bid
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