Proposal No. 8 — Highway Traffic Signs - Aluminum Blanks

Mandel Metals Inc. DBA
US Standard Sign 11406

VULCAN INC., DBA Vulcan

Osburn Associates

BLANKS . .~ |Aluminum PO Box 1850 Foley, AL Inc. PO Box 912
Addison Ave. Franklin 36536
Park, IL 60131 Logan, OH 43138
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
48" x 24" $17.79 $19.44 $18.56
36" x 36" $21.13 $21.71 $20.88
36" x 30" $16.76 $18.19 $17.40
36" x 12" $6.70 $7.36 $6.96
30" x 30" $13.96 $14.74 $14.48
24" x 30" $11.18 $12.09 $11.60
24" x 18" $6.70 $7.42 $6.96
18" x 18" $5.02 $5.55 $5.22
12" x 18" $3.53 $3.77 $3.48
12" x 12" $2.73 $2.41 $2.32
18" x 6" $2.18 $1.89 $1.74
36" x 9" $4.99 $5.59 $5.22
30" x 9" $4.20 $4.46 $4.35
24" x 9" $3.53 $3.54 $3.48
36" x 6" $3.53 $3.80 $3.48
30" x 6" $3.14 $3.00 $2.90
24" x 6" $2.73 $24.80 $2.32
60" x 18" $17.60 $18.19 $17.40
60" x 24" $23.46 $24.27 $23.20
48" x 18" $13.40 $14.67 $13.92
48"x 24" $17.79 $19.44 $18.56
36" x 18" $10.01 $10.94 $10.44
30" x 18" $8.38 $8.95 $8.70
STOP | US Standard Sign 12406 |, VULCAN INC., DBA Vulcan | Osburh Associates
. .~ |Aluminum PO Box 1850 Foley, AL Inc. PO Box 912
BLANKS Addison Ave. Franklin 36536
Park, IL 60131 Logan, OH 43138
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 36" $18.80 $19.21 $20.88
30" x 30" $13.06 $13.19 $14.48
BLANKS - |G e ole e, o | VULCAN INC, DBA vulcan | Osburn Associates
. .~ |Aluminum PO Box 1850 Foley, AL Inc. PO Box 912
R.R. Addison Ave. Franklin 36536 Lo
ADVANCE Park, IL 60131 gan, OH 43138
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" $21.11 $20.27 $22.32
36"x48"x48" $15.70 $15.86 $27.84




Proposal No. 9 — Highway Traffic Signs

Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 3030 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
12" x 36" $4.14 $6.78
24" x 42" $9.66 $15.76
30" x 30" $8.63 $11.12
12" x 18" $2.07 $4.82
30" x 36" $10.35 12.76
30" x 18" $5.18 10.70
48" x 24" $11.04 13.39
30" STOPS $8.63 11.12
36" STOPS $12.42 14.75
24" x 30" $6.90 $9.46
24" x 24" $5.52 $10.19
24" x18" $4.14 $6.81
12"x12" $1.38 $6.20
18"x 6" $1.04 $3.81
48" x 30" $13.80 $16.04
36" x 36" $12.42 $14.75
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 3030 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" x 30" $8.63 $11.12
36" x 36" $12.42 $14.75
24" x 24" $5.52 $8.14
24" x 30" $6.90 $9.46
12" x 18" $2.07 $4.82
30" x 36" $10.35 $12.76
30" x 18" $5.18 $10.70
36" STOP AHEAD $12.42 $18.84
36" SIGNAL
AHEAD $12.42 $19.64
36" x 48" x 48" NO
PASSING ZONE $16.56 $10.74
48" x 24" $11.04 $13.39
12" x 36" $4.14 $6.78
24" x18" $4.14 $6.81
24" x 42" $9.66 $15.76
12"x12" $1.38 $7.06
18" x6" $1.04 $3.81
48" x 30" $13.80 $16.04
36" YIELD AHEAD $12.42 $23.45
36" ROUND $12.42 $14.75
30" x 12" $3.45 $9.81
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 4084 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" DIAMOND $19.88 $23.94
48" DIAMOND $50.88 $56.59
48" x 18" $19.08 $22.97
36" DIAMOND $28.62 $33.16
30" x 24" $15.90 $19.71
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 4083 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" DIAMOND $28.62 $33.16
30" x12" $7.95 $15.06
30" x 18" $11.93 $15.48
24" x8" $4.24 $7.32
24" x12" $6.36 $9.59
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 4000 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
[ Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" sToP $45.88 $49.14
[ 36" STOP $66.06 $68.80
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 4000 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" STOP $49.32 $53.07
30" STOP. $34.25 $37.68
36" YIELD $24.66 $28.13
8" x 6" ALL-
WAY $4.11 $7.83
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 3030 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 48" x 48"
NO PASSING $46.08 $26.10
ZONE
36" ROUND
ADVANCE $34.56 $37.17
RAILROAD
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 4083 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
[ Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
| 36" scHooL $50.22 $54.21
[_36"_DIAMOND $50.22 $53.67
Osburn Newman Signs Inc.
Series 3030 Associates Inc. 1606 6th Ave. SW
PO Box 912 Jamestown, ND
Logan, OH 43138 58401
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
24" x6" $6.78 $8.39
30" x6" $8.48 $9.59
36" x 6" 10.17 10.80
24"x9" 10.17 10.82
30"x9" 12.71 12.62
36" x9" $15.26 14.41




Proposal No. 11 — Metal Culve

rt Pipe and Bands

ITEM1 - CMP

St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 202 Morrell Street Charlotte, Ml 48813

ITEM 2 - Poly-Coated CMP

St. Regis Culvert, Inc. 202 Morrell Street Charlotte, Ml 48813

" " 12 10 " " 16 14 12 10 8
Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge | 14 Gauge Gauge | Gauge 8 Gauge Bands Pipe Diameter Gauge | Gauge | Gauge | Gauge | Gauge Bands
12" $ 6.80|$% 895 NoBid | NoBid | No Bid 13.45 (1FT) 12" $10.00 | $12.00 | Nobid | Nobid | No bid 19.8 (1L FT)
15 $ 825($ 11.20| NoBid | NoBid | No Bid 16.80 (1 FT) 15 $12.00| $15.00 | Nobid | Nobid | No bid 225(1FT)
18" $ 10.30| $ 13.40| NoBid | No Bid No Bid 20.10 (1 FT) 18" $15.00 | $18.00 | Nobid | Nobid | No bid 29.00 (1 FT)
21" $ 1165| $ 16.65| NoBid | NoBid No Bid 24.98 (1FT) 21" $17.00| $21.00 | Nobid | Nobid | No bid 34.65 (1LFT)
24" $ 13.00{ $ 17.90| NoBid | No Bid No Bid 295 (1FT) 24" $19.00 | $24.00 | Nobid | Nobid | No bid 39.60 (1LFT)
30" $ 17.05| $ 2235 NoBid | NoBid No Bid 3353 (1FT) 30" $24.00| $30.00| Nobid | Nobid | No bid 49.50 (1 FT)
36" $ 2160| $ 26.85| $ 35.10| NoBid No Bid 70.20 (2 FT) 36" $29.00 | $36.00| Nobid | Nobid | No bid 72.00 (2 FT)
42" $ 2550( $ 31.50| $ 44.46| NoBid No Bid 88.00 (2FT) 42" $34.00| $42.00| Nobid | Nobid | No bid 84.00 (2FT)
48" $ 2830 $ 3580 $ 50.70| NoBid No Bid 100.40 (2 FT) 48" $38.00| $48.00 | $65.00| Nobid | No bid 130.00 (2 FT)
54" NoBid | $ 42.40| $ 57.30| No Bid No Bid 114.60 (2 FT) 54" No bid | $54.00| $73.00 | Nobid | No bid 146.00 (2 FT)
Jensen Bridge & Supply Company 400 Stoney Creek Drive, PO BOX 151 Sandusky, Ml 48471 Jensen Bridge & Supply Company 400 Stoney Creek Drive, PO BOX 151 Sandusky, Ml 48471
12 10 16 14 12 10 8
Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge | 14 Gauge Gauge | Gauge 8 Gauge Bands Pipe Diameter Gauge | Gauge | Gauge | Gauge | Gauge Bands
127 $ 6.05|$% 491 $ 10.60| NoBid No Bid $ 9.07 127 $ 9.35| $11.25| $14.86 | NoBid | No Bid $ 14.02
15" $ 745| % 9.85( $ 11.92| NoBid No Bid $ 11.17 15" $11.29| $13.96 | $16.63| NoBid | No Bid $ 16.93
18" $ 930|$ 11.71| $ 16.05| NoBid No Bid $ 13.95 18" $13.51| $16.65| $22.50 | NoBid | No Bid $ 20.26
21" $ 1120 $ 13.70( $ 18.18| No Bid No Bid $ 16.80 21" $15.65| $19.35| $25.34| NoBid | No Bid $ 23.47
24" $ 11.75| $ 15.88| $ 22.57 | NoBid No Bid $ 17.62 24" $17.85| $22.04| $30.71| NoBid | No Bid $ 26.77
30" $ 16.79| $ 20.28| $ 26.14 | $ 36.62| No Bid $ 35.49 30" $22.21| $27.44| $35.96 | NoBid | No Bid $ 48.02
36" $ 2017|$ 2430 $ 32.04| $ 44.65| NoBid $ 42.52 36" $26.56 | $34.67 | $43.57 | $58.35 | No Bid $ 60.67
42" $ 2496| $ 28.88| $ 37.94| $ 49.37| NoBid $ 50.54 42" $30.92| $38.58| $50.70 | $68.75 | No Bid $ 67.51
48" $ 2876 $ 3321 $ 4250 | $ 59.40| No Bid $ 85.00 48" $37.50 | $45.89 | $59.32 | $79.51 | No Bid $ 118.64
54" $ 3496| $ 39.63( $ 51.13| $ 70.89| No Bid $ 102.26 54" $44.78 | $53.94| $68.97 | $91.83 | No Bid $ 137.94
Cadillac Culvert, Inc. 5305 M-115 Cadillac, Ml 49601 Cadillac Culvert, Inc. 5305 M-115 Cadillac, Ml 49601
" " 12 10 " " 16 14 12 10 8
Pipe Diameter 16 Gauge | 14 Gauge Gauge | Gauge 8 Gauge Bands Pipe Diameter Gauge | Gauge | Gauge | Gauge | Gauge Bands
" 12 wide - 10 .
12 $ 587|$% 730|$1097| NoBid | No Bid 24 wide 11.6 12 $ 7.63| $ 9.49 | $14.26 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
15" $ 702|$ 915|$1235| NoBid | No Bid 12 wide - 12.00 15" $ 913 $11.87| $16.05| NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 14.00
18" $ 850|$ 10.80( $ 16.55| No Bid No Bid 12 wide - 16.00 18" $11.05| $14.04| $21.52| NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 17.00
21" $ 975|$ 13.20( $ 18.85| NoBid No Bid 12 wide - 18.00 21" $12.68| $17.15| $24.50 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 19.5
24" $ 11.05| $ 14.60( $ 19.90| No Bid No Bid 12 wide - 21.00 24" $14.37 | $19.71| $26.87 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 22.10
307 $ 16.15| $ 17.80( $ 24.80| $ 32.20| No Bid 12 wide - 29.00 30" $21.00 | $24.03| $41.86 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 32.3
36" $ 19.78| $ 22.95( $ 30.24 | $ 38.82| No Bid 12 wide - 34.00 36" $25.72| $30.98| $50.46 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 39.4
42" $ 2335|$ 28.75| $ 35.10 | $ 46.34| No Bid 12 wide - 40.00 42" $31.52| $38.81| $57.92| NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 46.7
48" $ 2820| $ 34.20| $ 40.35| $ 51.81| No Bid 12 wide - 65.00 48" $40.40| $46.17 | $64.76 | NoBid | No Bid No Bid
24 wide - 86.4
" 12 wide - 70 N
54 $ 3450 $ 41.40( $ 45.38| $ 59.94| No Bid 24 wide 99 54 $48.30| $57.96 | $71.93| No Bid | No Bid No Bid




Proposal No. 12 — 31A Aggregate

Bidder's Name

Chesaning Garage -
Material & Trucking

Hemlock Garage -
Material & Trucking

Saginaw Co. Road
Garage -
Material & Trucking

Geddes Road Pit -
Material & Trucking

Curtis Road Pit -
Material & Trucking

Fisher Transportation
900 S. Bradley Mt.
Pleasant, MI 48858

$30.30

$28.50

$24.68

$26.25

$26.03

Burroughs North 1701
N. 1st Street Saginaw,
MI 48601

$22.45

$20.85

$19.50

$20.50

$20.50

Specification Stone
Products 1009
Long Lake Rd. Alpena,

MI 49707

$22.40

$20.85

$20.35

$20.85

$20.85

Wirt Stone Dock
4700 Crow Island Rd.
Saginaw, MI 48601

$21.72

$20.37

$18.92

$19.97

$19.97

*31A will be subtituted with 29A

*All materials are stockpiled outside and exposed to all weather conditions



Proposal #14 Ready Mix Concrete - Wet or Dry

F.O.B. County Trucks at Plant — 4% Sack

Bidder’'s Name

Price/Cu. Yard

Add Price per
Cubic Yard per
mile past free
delivery zone

Free Delivery
Zone

Add Price per

Cubic Yard at

or after 3:00
om

No - Bids
Add Price per Free
Cubic Yard Unloading
Saturday Time

Dummerage

Add Price per
Cubic Yard
Chloride Concrete

NONE

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites

— Saginaw County 5 Yards and Over

Bidder’'s Name

5 Sack per
cu. Yard

Price Per
Cubic Yard

9 Sack per
cu. yard

NONE

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites

— Saginaw County 4 to 5 Yards

Bidder's Name

5 Sack

Price Per

9 Sack Cubic Yard

NONE

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites

— Saginaw County 3to 4 Yards

Bidder’'s Name

5 Sack

Price Per

9 Sack Cubic Yard

NONE

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites

— Saginaw County 2 to 3 Yards

Bidder's Name

5 Sack

Price Per

9 Sack Cubic Yard

NONE

Per Cubic Yard Delivered to Project Sites

ards

Bidder’'s Name

5 Sack

— Saginaw County Under 2'Y
Price Per
9 Sack Cubic Yard

NONE




Proposal No. 15— C S 2 Trap Rock & 29A Limestone 50/50

Bidder’'s Name

Wirt Stone Dock

4700 Crow Island Rd.

Saginaw, Ml 48601

Burroughs North
1701 N. 1st Street
Saginaw, Ml 48601

Geddes Rd. Pit $26.10 $26.98
Curtis Rd. Pit $26.10 $26.88
Chesaning Garage $27.45 $28.25
Hemlock Garage $26.60 $27.35
S.C.R.C. Garage $25.15 $25.83
Pick-up by SCRC $22.60 $23.75
Albee Twp. $27.15 $27.58
Birch Run Twp. $27.20 $27.53
Blumfield Twp. $26.05 $26.48
Brady Twp. $28.65 $29.08
Brant Twp. $28.45 $28.88
Bridgeport Twp. $26.05 $26.38
Buena Vista Twp. $25.70 $26.03
Carrollton Twp. $25.95 $26.38
Chapin Twp. $29.25 $29.68
Chesaning Twp. $28.65 $28.98
Frankenmuth Twp. $26.95 $27.28
Fremont Twp. $27.45 $27.88
James Twp. $26.20 $26.63
Jonesfield Twp. $27.45 $27.88
Kochville Twp. $25.95 $26.28
Lakefield Twp. $28.30 $28.73
Maple Grove Twp. $27.35 $27.78
Marion Twp. $28.45 $28.88
Richland Twp. $27.35 $27.78
Saginaw Twp. $26.05 $26.48
St. Charles Twp. $27.70 $28.13
Spaulding Twp. $26.55 $26.88
Swan Creek Twp. $26.95 $27.38
Taymouth Twp. $26.95 $27.38
Thomas Twp. $26.45 $26.88
Titt. Twp. $26.60 $26.93
Zilwaukee Twp. $25.95 $26.23




Proposal No. 17- Bituminous Patching Materials (Cold Patch)

Item No. 1 - Styrelf Emulsion Based CP-6

FOB. | it | Heomlook | FOB:
Bidder's Name County Chesaning
Trucks Storage | Storage Storage Yard
Yard Yard

Unique Paving Materials

3993 E. 93rd St. Cleveland, | $89.00 | $92.25 $93.75 $96.05

OH 44105

Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.

2981 Carrollton Rd. Saginaw,| $88.50 | $88.00 $89.00 $89.95

MI 48604

Iltem 2 - Hot Mix Bituminous Materials Material No. 1100T (20AA)

F.O.B.
Bidders Name County
Trucks

Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.
2981 Carrollton Rd. Saginaw,| $52.50

MI 48604

*UPM Mix



Proposal No. 22 — Stump Removal

Bidder's Name

Price per Inch

Price per Hour

Mid Michigan Contracting
5563 Dixie Hwy.
Saginaw, Ml 48603

$0.75

$73.00

Jameson Tree Service 4580
Monitor Rd. Bay City,
Ml 48708

$0.85

$80.00

Wonsey Tree Service
PO Box 1142
Alma, Ml 48801

$3.50

$120.00




Proposal No. 24 — Bituminous Sand - 2NS

: ) Geddes Road | Curtis Road | Chesaning | Hemlock | S.C.R.C. Pick-up By
Bidder’'s Name : : Rd. Comm.
Borrow Pit Borrow Pit Garage Garage | Garage
Trucks
L&D Carey & Sons Trucking
3200 Northland Dr. $10.25 $10.95 $9.90 $10.25 $10.95 No Bid
Morley, M1 49336
Steve Krupp Trucking
2516 Peet Rd. $9.85 $11.00 $7.85 $9.85 $11.00 No Bid

New Lothrop, Ml 48460




Proposal No. 26 — Crushed Limestone — 23A

Stoneco of Michigan Specification Stone Products |Burroughs North 1701 Fisher Transportation WIRT Saginaw Stone Dock
Bidder’'s Name 15203 S. Telegraph Road 1009 Long Lake Road Alpena, N. 1st Street 900 South Bradley Mt. 4700 Crow Island Rd.
Monroe, M| 48161 M| 49707 Saginaw, MI 48601 Pleasant, M| 48858 Saginaw, MI 48601

Loading Point (Location) 6299 Bellview Ave. Flint 2594 oil(davlfli‘;vvl\(/ﬁr\:llm Rd. 1701 N. 1st Street Saginaw Bay Aggregate 4;,(\)%Rgrosv3§|1;rl1:r\:(ljsl'\£3hesggoiﬁgw
F.0.B. Loading Point $16.50 $11.80 $13.95 No Bid $11.85
F.0.B. Saginaw Garage (4000 ton approx) $25.00 $15.65 $16.40 $20.19 $14.40
F.O.B. Chesaning Garage (2000 ton approx) $22.00 $17.70 $18.80 $25.06 $16.70
F.0.B. Hemlock Garage (2000 ton approx) $26.00 $16.15 $17.95 $23.50 $15.85
F.O.B. Albee Twp. $21.90 $17.50 $18.15 $22.39 $15.85
F.0.B. Birch Run Twp. $21.00 $17.50 $18.20 $22.57 $15.90
F.O0.B. Blumfield Twp. $22.25 $16.35 $17.05 $18.90 $14.75
F.O.B. Brady Twp. $22.10 $19.00 $19.65 $25.81 $17.35
F.O.B. Brant Twp. $25.00 $19.10 $19.45 $24.66 $17.15
F.O.B. Bridgeport Twp. $21.60 $16.85 $17.05 $20.77 $14.75
F.O.B. Buena Vista Twp. $22.10 $16.00 $16.70 $19.12 $14.40
F.O.B. Carrollton Twp. $24.25 $16.00 $16.95 $18.97 $14.65
F.O.B. Chapin Twp. $24.25 $19.70 $20.25 $26.71 $17.85
F.0.B. Chesaning Twp. $22.10 $19.10 $19.65 $24.37 $17.35
F.O.B. Frankenmuth Twp. $21.25 $17.40 $17.95 $21.78 $15.65
F.O0.B. Fremont Twp. $26.50 $17.70 $18.45 $23.40 $16.15
F.O.B. James Twp. $25.15 $16.85 $17.20 $20.74 $14.90
F.0.B. Jonesfield Twp. $27.00 $17.50 $18.45 $23.00 $16.15
F.O.B. Kochville Twp. $25.00 $14.99 $16.95 $18.43 $14.65
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. $26.80 $18.30 $19.30 $24.44 $17.00
F.0.B. Maple Grove Twp. $21.50 $17.70 $18.35 $23.22 $16.05
F.O0.B. Marion Twp. $26.00 $19.10 $19.45 $25.63 $17.15
F.O.B. Richland Twp. $26.15 $17.50 $18.35 $22.18 $16.05
F.O.B. Saginaw Twp. $25.00 $16.10 $17.05 $19.91 $14.75
F.O.B. St. Charles Twp. $25.00 $17.70 $18.70 $23.44 $16.40
F.0.B. Spaulding Twp. $22.10 $17.40 $17.45 $20.74 $15.25
F.O.B. Swan Creek Twp. $25.15 $17.50 $17.95 $22.18 $15.65
F.0.B. Taymouth Twp. $21.35 $17.50 $17.95 $22.00 $15.65
F.O.B. Thomas Twp. $25.15 $16.85 $17.45 $20.74 $15.15
F.O.B. Tittabawassee Twp. $27.00 $16.85 $17.60 $19.73 $15.30
F.O.B. Zilwaukee Twp. $24.25 $16.00 $16.95 $18.50 $14.65




Proposal No. 27 — Pavement Marking - Symbols

Item No. 1 - Remove Existing Markings

. , Quantity (Estimated) Total of Item
Bidder's Name 1000 SFT #1+2+3
M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO Box 0.50 M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO $2.90
530 Grand Blanc, MI 48480 ! Box 530 Grand Blanc, Ml 48480 :
Asphalt Concrete Service 2715 S. Huron 0.74 Asphalt Concrete Service 2715 S. $2.53
Rd. Kawkawlin, MI 48631 ’ Huron Rd. Kawkawlin, MI 48631 ’
P.K. Contracting, INC. 6344 W. Blue Rd. 0.65 P.K. Contracting, INC. 6344 W. Blue $3.95

Lake City, MI 49651

Rd. Lake City, MI 49651

Item No. 2 - Regular Dry Pavement Mark

ings (PAINT NEW SYMBOLS)

Bidder's Name

Quantity (Estimated)

1000 SFT
M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO Box 120
530 Grand Blanc, MI 48480 ’
Asphalt Concrete Service 2715 S. Huron 0.89
Rd. Kawkawlin, Ml 48631 :
P.K. Contracting, INC. 6344
W. Blue Rd. Lake City, 1.65

MI 49651

Item No. 3 - Regular Dry Pavement Marki

ng (REPAINT EXISTIN

G SYMBOLS)

Bidder's Name

Quantity (Estimated)

5260 SFT
M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO Box 12
530 Grand Blanc, MI 48480 !
Asphalt Concrete Service 2715 S. Huron 0.9
Rd. Kawkawlin, MI 48631 ’
P.K. Contracting, INC. 6344 W. Blue Rd. 165

Lake City, MI 49651




Proposal No. 28 - Pavement Marking, Cold Applied

Item No.1 - + 1,400,000

Ft. Yellow Line as directed

Bidder's Name

M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO
Box 530 Grand
Blanc, Ml 48480

P.K. Contracting, INC.
6344 W. Blue Rd.
Lake City, Ml 49651

Labor & Equipment
(Price Per Foot)

$0.0008

No bid

*Paint & Beads
(Price Per Foot)

$0.0380

$0.04

Item No. 2 - + 3,200,000

Ft. White Line as directed

Bidder's Name

M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO
Box 530 Grand
Blanc, Ml 48480

P.K. Contracting, INC.
6344 W. Blue Rd.
Lake City, Ml 49651

Labor & Equipment
(Price Per Foot)

$0.0008

No bid

*Paint & Beads
(Price Per Foot)

$0.0380

$0.04

Item No. 3 - Yellow Regu

lar Dry Solvent (Fall Quantities Unknown)

Bidder's Name

M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO
Box 530 Grand
Blanc, Ml 48480

P.K. Contracting, INC.
6344 W. Blue Rd.
Lake City, Ml 49651

Labor & Equipment
(Price Per Foot)

$0.01

No bid

*Paint & Beads
(Prince Per Foot)

$0.04

$0.052

Item No. 4 - White Reqular Dry Solvent (Fall Quantities Unknown)

Bidder's Name

M&M Pavement Marking, INC. PO
Box 530 Grand
Blanc, Ml 48480

P.K. Contracting, INC.
6344 W. Blue Rd.
Lake City, Ml 49651

Labor & Equipment
(Price Per Foot)

$0.01

No bid

*Paint & Beads
(Price Per Foot)

$0.04

$0.047




Proposal No. 32 - Grass Seed

Bidder's Name

Type #1 Seed
Mixture

Type #2 Seed
Mixture

Hanes Geo Components
38160 Anrhein
Livonia, Ml 48150

$1.591

$1.561

79.50/50Ib bag

78.00/50Ib bag




Proposal No. 35 - Raised Thermoplastic Rumble Strips

Bidder's Name Pay Unit Foot

P.K. Contracting, INC.
6344 W. Blue Rd. $7.00
Lake City, Ml 49651




Proposal No. 36 — Modified Natural Gravel — 23A

Bidder’'s Name

L&D Carey & Sons Trucking
3200 Northland Dr.
Morley, MI 49336

Burroughs North
1701 N. 1st Street
Saginaw, Ml 48601

Fisher Transportation
900 South Bradley
Mt. Pleasant, MI 48858

F.O.B. Loading Point No bid $6.25 No bid
F.O.B. Saginaw
Garage (1000 ton $13.00 $11.45 No bid
approx)
F.O.B. Chesaning
Garage (1000 ton $10.35 $12.65 $11.11
approx)
F.O.B. Hemlock
Garage (2000 ton $11.83 $12.65 $11.21
approx)
F.O.B. Albee Twp. $12.15 No bid No bid
F.0.B. Birch Run $12.82 No bid No bid
Twp.
F.O.B. Blumfield Twp. $14.80 No bid No bid
F.O.B. Brady Twp. $9.50 No bid $9.38
F.O.B. Brant Twp. $10.30 No bid $9.92
F.O.B. Bridgeport $13.05 No bid No bid
Twp.

F.0.B. Buena Vista $14.75 No bid No bid
Twp.

F.O.B. Chapin Twp. $9.35 No bid $9.17

F.O.B. Chesaning $10.50 No bid $9.99
Twp.

F.O.B. Frankenmuth $13.75 No bid No bid
Twp.

F.O.B. Fremont Twp. $11.25 No bid $10.73
F.0.B. James Twp. $12.75 No bid No bid
F.0.B. Jonesfield $11.90 No bid $9.99

Twp.
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. $10.75 No bid $10.14
F.0.B. Maple Grove $11.29 No bid No bid
Twp.
F.O0.B. Marion Twp. $10.40 No bid $9.65
F.0.B. Richland Twp. $12.00 No bid $10.97
F.O.B. St. Charles $11.35 No bid $10.90
Twp.

F.0.B. Spaulding $12.00 No bid No bid
Twp.

F.0.B. Swan Creek $11.75 No bid $11.32
Twp.

F.0.B. Taymouth $12.55 No bid No bid
Twp.

F.O.B. Thomas Twp. $12.40 No bid $11.25
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